Cerfifled to be
a true copy of
said document
on filein my
office.

S

City Clerk of
the City of
Manbattan
Beach

ORDINANCE NO 13-0027

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CIiTY OF MANHATTAN BEACH
AMENDING CHAPTER 5.26 OF TITLE 5 OF THE MANHATTAN
BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE; ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2013
EDITIONS OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, CALIFORNIA
RESIDENTIAL CODE, CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE,
CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL
CODE, CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, AND
THE CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE; TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN
DELETIONS, ADDITIONS AND AMENDMENTS; AND AMENDING
TITLE 9 OF THE MANHATTAN BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE.

THE CiTY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MANHATTAN BEACH DOES ORDAIN AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION1.  The City Council hereby finds that it can be seen with certainty that there is
no possibility that the adoption of this Ordinance may have a significant effect on the environment. It
is therafore exempt from review under the California Environmental Quality Act pursuant to Title 14,
Section 15061(b)(3) of the California Code of Regulaticns (CEQA Guidelines).

SECTION 2. Chapter 9.01 of Tifle 9 of the Manhattan Beach Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

Chapter 9.01 BUILDING CODE.
9.01.010 Adoption of the 2013 California Building Code.

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 50022.1 to 50022.10, inclusive, of the Government Code of the
State and subject to the particular additions, deletions and amendments set forth in this chapter, the
rules, regulations, provisions and conditions set forth in that certain Code entitled California Building
Code 2013 Edition,” including the Appendices and Standards (including Chapter/Section 1, Division
2; Chapter 31B; and excluding all Appendices with the exception of Appendices | and J) therein
contained, promulgated and published by the International Code Council and the California Building
Standards Commission, one (1) fult printed copy of which, printed as a Code in book form were by the
Council ordered filed and which have been filed in the office of the City Clerk, expressly incorporated
herein and made a parl hereof as fully and for alt intents and purposes as though set forth herein at
length, are hereby established and adopted as the rules, regulations, provisions and conditions 1o be
observed and followed in the construction, alteration, improvements, movement, enlargement,
replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, maintenance, removal, demolition,
conversion, area and height, of buildings or structures or any appurtenances connected or attached
1o such bulldings or structures in the city; and subject to the additions, deletions and amendments set
forth in this chapter, said Code with its Appendices and the said Standards containing said rules,
regulations, standards, provisions and conditions is hereby established and adopted by reference,
and the same shall be designated, known and referred to as the “Building Code” of and for the City.

9.01.020 Referenced codes.
Section [A}101.4 is amended to read as follows:
Section [A]101.4. Referenced codes. The other codes listed in Sections [A[101.4.1 through

[A[101.4.6 and referenced elsewhers in this code shall be considered part of the requirements of this

12100-0001\1644828v3.doc 1



Certifled to be
atrue copy of
said document
on file in my
office,

—

City Clerk of
the City of
Manhattan
Beach

code fo the prescribed extent of each such reference. Specifically, the Electrical, Gas, Mechanical,

Plumbing, Swimming Pool, and Energy Codes; the most recently adopted California State and
Manhattan Beach Municipal Codes will take precedence.

9.01.030 Work exempt from permit.

Section [A]105.2, item 2 is amended to read as follows:
2. Fances not over 6 feet (1829 mm) high,

Section [A]105.2, item 9 is amended to read as follows:

9. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory 1o Group R-3 Occupancy that are less than 24 18 inches
(457 mm) deep, do not exceed 5,000 gallons (18925 L) and installed entirely above ground.

9.01.040 Expiration of plan review.
Section [A[105.3.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section [A[105.3.2 Time limitation of application. Applications for which no permit is issued within
180 days following the date of application shall expire by limitation and plans and other data
submitted for review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by the Building Official.
The Building Official may extend the time for action by applicant for a period not exceeding 180 days
upon written request by the applicant and justifiable cause demonstrated. No application shall be
extended more than once. In order to renew action on an application after expiration, the applicant

shall resubmit plans and pay a new plan review fee and plans shall be reviewed under the current
codes and ordinances at the time of the new applications.

9.01.050 Permit expiration.
Section [A]105.5 is amended to read as follows:

[A]105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized
by such permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work authorized on the site
by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 days after the work is commenced, or

if the building or work authorized by such permit is not completed within 2 calendar years from the
issuance date of the permit.

Before such work can be recommenced, & new permit, or a renewed permit as specified below, shall
be first obtained. No permit shall be renewed mora than once.

For parmits where work has not commenced within 180 days from the date of such permit, a renewed
permit may be obtained provided that: (1) no changes have been made or will be required in the

original plans and specifications for such work; and (2) the expiration has not exceeded two years
from the original issuance date.

For permits where work had commenced and was subsequenily suspended or abandoned for a
period exceeding 180 days, a renewed permit may be obtained provided that: (1) No changes have
been made or will be required in the original plans and specifications for such work; and (2) the
expiration has not exceeded two years from the issuance date and/or (3) Where construction has
progressed and has been approved to the point whereby only a final inspection(s) is required, a fea
shall be determined based on the number of estimated inspections, estimated staff time, and required
meetings as determined by the Building Official.

12100-000111644828v3.doc 2



fied to be
py of
cument
in my

25

of

=

For permits that have exceeded two years beyond the issuance date, a new permit is required. The
applicant shall pay the fee based on the valuation of the uncomplated work required for a plan check

and a new permit and plans will be reviewed under the current codes and ordinances at the time of
the new applications.

Any permitiee holding an unexpired permit may apply for an extension of the time within which work
under that permit may be continued when, for good and satistactory reasons, the permittee is unable
to continue work within the time required by this section. The Building Official may extend the time for
action by the permitiee for a period not exceeding six calendar months upon written request by the
psrmittee showing that circumstances beyond the control of the permittee have prevented action from
being taken. No permit shall be extended more than once.

If the owner or applicant fails to complete the construction work within the time raquired, the Building
Official is authorized to obtain the abatement of any unsafe condition or nuisance created by such
incomplete work, The City Attorney is authorized 1o file an action for the abatement of any such
unsate condition or nuisance i required to do so by the Building Offictal.

9.01.060 Fees.
Sections [A]109.2 and [A]109.4 are amended to read as follows:

[A[199.2 Schedule of permit fees. The fees shall be determined by the mast current City Resolution
of Fees.

Plan Review Fees. When submitial documents are required by the building official, a plan review fee
shall be paid at the time of submitting the submittal documents for plan review. Said plan review fee
shall be determined by the most current City Resolution of Fees.

The plan review fees specified in this section are separate fees from the permit fees and are in
addition to the permit fees.

When submittal documents are incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan review or
when the project involves deferred submittal items as defined in Section [A[107.3.4.2, an additional
plan review fee shall be charged as determined by the most current City Resolution of Fees.

[A]109.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any work on a
building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system before obtaining the necessary
permits shall be subject to a fee established by the Building Official and the most current Manhattan
Beach Resolution of Fees in addition to the required permit fees.

Investigation. Whenever any work for which a permit Is required by this code has been commenced
without first obtaining said permit, a special investigation shall be made before a permit may be
issued for such work.

Investigation Fee. An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected whether or not
a permit is then or subsequently issued. The investigation fee shali be equal up to the amount of the
permit fee required by this code as determined by the Building Official. The minimum investigation
fee shall be determined by the most current Resolution of Fees, The payment of such investigation

fee shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions of this cede nor from any
penailty prescribed by law.

12100-000111644828v3.doc 3



Certified to be
& true copy of
said document
on file in my
ofiice,

SS

City Clerk of

the City of
Marnhattan
Beach

9.01.070 Violation penaities.
Section [A[114.4 is amended to raad as follows:

[AlSection 114.4. Violation penalties. Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a building or
structure in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the building official, or of
a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this cods, shall be subject to the penalties as
prescribed by law. Every person who willfully resists, delays, obstructs or interferes in any way with any
City Buiiding Inspecior in the discharge or attempt to discharge any duty of his or her office or
employment shall be guilty of a violation of this Chapter

Any person, firm, or corporation violating any of the provisions or failing to comply with any of the
randatory requirements of the ordinances of Manhattan Beach shall be guilty of a misdemeanor.
Any person convicted of a misdemeanor under the ordinances of Manhattan Beach shall be punished
by a fine of nol more than one thousand doltars ($1,000), or by imprisonment not to exceed six 6)
months, or by both such fine and imprisenment. Each such person shall be guilty of a separate
coffense for each and every day during any portion of which any violation of any provision of the
ordinances of Manhattan Beach is commitied, continued, or parmitted by any such person, and shall
be punished accordingly.

9.01.080 Definitions.

Section 202 is amended by adding a definition to read as follows:

ABANDONED OR SUSPENDED WORK. Work that has been stopped or no progress in construction
and no inspection is required or performed for & period of 180 days.

9.01.090 Yards.

Section 1206.2 is amended by adding Exception 1 to read as follows:

Exceptlon 1. One and two family dwellings not exceeding three stories, which are located on a 30
foot wide lot or less may have 3 foot (914 mm) side yards, if additional artificial light and mechanical
ventilation are provided for the structure as determined to be adequate by the building official,
9.01.100 Roofing and re-roofing.

Table 1505.1 is amended to read as follows:

Table 1505.1. Minimum Roof Covering Classification for Types of Construction. All roof
classifications of “C” shall be deleted from Table 1505.1 and replaced by class “B” roof classification.

Sections 1505 and 1507 are amended by adding a sentence to each that reads as follows:

Fire-retardant roofs are roofing assemblies complying with Calfornia Building Code Standards and
listed as Class A or B roofs. The use of fire-retardant wood shakes or fire retardant wood shingles is
prohibited.

Section 1505.5 is amended to read as follows:

12100-000141 644828v3.doc 4



Certified to be
atrue copy of
s2id document
on flain my
office.

5

City Clerk of

the Cily of
hattan
ch

1506.5 Non-classlified Roofing. Non-classified roofing is approved material that is not listed as a
Class A or B roafing assembly. The use of wood shakes or wood shingles is prohibited.

Sections 1505.4 1505.5, 1507.6, and 1507.7 are heraby deleted [DO YOU WANT TO AMEND 1505.5
OR DELETE IT?

Section 1510.1 is amended by adding Exception 2 to read as follows:

Exception 2. All re-roofing shall conform to the applicable provisions of Chapter 15 of this code and
as otherwise raquired in this chapter.

Roofing materials and methods of application shall comply with the California Building Code
standards or shall follow the manufacturer's installation requirements when approved by the building
official.

Wood shakes and wood shingles re-roofs of entire structure are prohibited unless approved by the
building official because of special circumstances.

9.01.110 General structural design provisions.

The following sections are amended to read as follows:
Section 1613.6 is added to read as follows:

1613.6 ASCE 7, 12.12.3

Moadify ASCE 7 Equation 12.12-1 of Section 12.12.3 to read as follows:

Oy = E%— (12.12-1)

Section 1613.7 is added to read as follows:

1613.7 ASCE 7, 12.2.3.1, Exception 3.

Modifty ASCE 7 Section 12.2.3.1 Exception 3 to read as follows:

3. Detached one- and two-tamily dwellings up to two stories in height of light frame construction.
Section 1613.8 is added to read as jollows:

1613.8 ASCE 7 12.11.2.2.3 Wood Diaphragms.

In wood diaphragms, the continuous ties shall be in addition to the diaphragm sheathing. Anchorage
shall not be accomplished by use of toe nails or nails subject to withdrawal nor shall wood ledgers or
framing be used in cross-grain bending or cross-grain tension. The diaphragm sheathing shall not be
considered effective as providing ties or struts required by this section.

For structures assigned to Seismic Design Calegory D, E or F, wood diaphragms supporting concrete
or masonry walls shall comply with the following:

1. The spacing of continuous ties shall not exceed 40 feet. Added chords of diaphragms may be
used to form subdiaphragms to transmit the anchorage forces to the main continuous
crossties.

12100-000111644828v3 doc 5



2.

The maximum diaphragm shear used to determine the depth of the subdiaphragm shall not
exceed 75% of the maximum diaphragm shear,

Section 1613.10 is added to read as follows:

1613.10 Suspended Ceilings.

Certified to be
atrue copy of
said document
on file in my
office,

S5

City Clerk of

the City of
Manhattan
Beach

Minimum design and instailation standards for suspended ceilings shall be determined in
accordance with the requirements of Section 2506.2.1 of this Code and this section.

1613.10.1 Scope. This part contains special requirements for suspended ceilings and lighting
systems. Provisions of Section 13.5.6 of ASCE 7-10 shall apply except as modified hersin.

1613.10.2 General. The suspended cailings and lighting systems shalt be limited to & feet

(1828 mm) below the siructural deck unless the lateral bracing is designed by a licensed
engineer or architect,

1613.10.3 Sprinkler Heads. All sprinkler heads (drops) except fire-resistance-rated
floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies, shall be designed to allow for free movement of the
sprinkler pipes with oversize rings, sleeves or adaplors through the cailing tite. Sprinkier
heads and other penetrations shall have a 2 in. (50mm) oversize ring, slesve, or adapter
through the ceiling tile to allow for free movement of at least 1 in. (25mm) in all horizontal
directions. Alternatively, a swing joint that can accommodate 1 in. (256 mm) of ceiling
movement in ali horizontal directions is permitted to be provided at the top of the sprinkier
head extension.

Sprinkler heads penetrating fire-resistance-rated floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies shall
comply with Section 714 of this Code.

1613.10.4 Special Requirements for Means of Egress. Suspended ceiling assemblies
{ocated along means of egress serving an occupant load of 30 or more shall comply with the
following provisions.

1613.10.4.1 General. Ceiling suspension systems shall be connected and braced with
vertical hangers attached directly to the structural deck along the means of egress serving an
occupant load of 30 or more and at lobbies accessory to Group A Occupancies. Spacing of
vertical hangers shall not exceed 2 feet (610 mm) on center along the entire length of the
suspended ceiling assembly located along the means of egress or at the lobby.

1613.10.4.2 Assembly Device. All lay-in panels shall be secured to the suspension cailing
assembly with two hold-down clips minimum for each tile within a 4-foot (1219 mm) radius of
the exit lights and exit signs.

1613.10.4.3 Emergency Systems. Independent supports and braces shall be provided for
light fixtures required for exit illumination. Power supply for exit illumination shali comply with
the requirements of Section 1006.3 of this Code.

1613.10.4.4 Supporis for Appendage. Separate suppon from the structural deck shali be
provided for all appendages such as light fixtures, air diffusers, exit signs, and similar
elements.

12100-000111644828v3.doc &



Section 1704.5 is amended to read as foliows:

1704.5 Structural Obssrvations.

Where required by the provisions of Section 1704.5.1 or 1704.5.2, the owner shall employ a
structural observer 1o perform structural observations as defined in Section 1702. The
structural observer shall be one of the following individuals:

1. The registered design professional responsible for the structural design, or

2. A registered design professional designated by the registered design professional
responsible for the structural design.

Prior to the commencement of observations, the structural observer shall submit to the

building official a written statement identifying the frequency and extent of structural
observations.

The owner or owner's representative shall coordinate and call a preconstruction meeting
between the structural cbserver, contractors, affected subcontractors and special inspectors.
The structural observer shall preside over the meeting. The purpose of the meeting shall be
to identify the major structural elements and conneclions that affect the verlical and iatera
load resisting systems of the structure and to review scheduling of the required observations.
A record of the meeting shali be included in the report submitted to the Building Officiai.

Observed deficiencies shall be reported in writing to the owner or owner's representative,
special inspecior, contractor and the Building Official. Upon the form prescribed by the
building official, the structural observer shall submit to the building official a written statement
at each significant construction stage stating thal the site visits have been made and
identifying any reported deficiencies which, to the best of the structural observer's knowledge,
have not been resolved. A final report by the structural observer which states that all

observed deficiencies have been resolved is required before acceptance of the work by the
Building Official.

Prior to the commencement of observations, the structural observer shall submit to the

building official a written statement identifying the frequency and exient of structural
observations.

The owner or owner's representative shall coordinate and call & preconstruction meeting
between the structural observer, contractors, affected subcontractors and special inspectors.
The structural observer shali preside over the meeting, The purpose of the mesting shall be
to identify the major structural elements and connections that affect the vertical and lateral
toad resisting systems of the structure and to review scheduling of the required observations.
A racord of the meeting shall be included in the report submitted to the Bullding Official.

Observed deficiencies shall be reported in writing to the owner or owner's representative,
special inspector, contractor and the building official. Upon the form prescribed by the
Building Official, the structural observer shall submit to the building official a written statement
at each significant construction stage stating that the site visits have been made and
identifying any reported deficiencies which, to the best of the structural observers knowledge,
have not been resolved. A final report by the structural observer which states that all

observed deficiencies have been resolved is required before acceptance of the work by the
Building Official.

12100-0001\1644828v3.doc 7



Section 1704.5.1 is amended to read as follows:
1704.5.1 Structural observations for seismic resistance.
Structural observations shall be provided for those structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, E or F, where one or more of the following conditions exist:
1. The structure is classified as Risk Category Il or IV in accordance with Table 1604.5.
2. The height of the structure is greater than 75 feet (22860 mm) above the base.

3. The structure is classified as Risk Category | or |l in accordance with Table 1604.5, and a
lateral design is required for the structure or portion thereof.

Exception: One-story wood framed Group R-3 and Group U Occupancies less than 2,000
square feet in area, provided the adjacent grade is not steeper than 1 unit vertical In 10 units
horizontal (10% sloped), assigned to Seismic Deslgn Category D.

4. When so designated by the registered design professional responsible for the structural
design.

5. When such observation is specifically required by the building official,

Section 1705.3 is amended to read as follows:

1705.3 Concrete Construction.

The special inspections and verifications for concrete construction shail be as required by this
section and Table 1705.3.

Exceptions: Special inspection shall not be required for:
1. Isolated spread concrete footings of buildings three stories or less above grade plane that
are fully supported on earth or rock, where the structural design of the footing is based on a

specified compressive strength, f'c, no greater than 2,500 pounds per square inch {psi) (17.2

Mpa) regardless of the compressive strength specified in the construction documents or used
in the footing construction.

2. Continuous concrete footings supporting walls of buildings three stories or less in height
that are fully supported on earth or rock where:

2.1. The footings support walls of lighl-frame construction;
2.2. The footings are designed in accordance with Table 1805.4.2; or
2.3. The structural design of the footing is based on a specified compressive
strength, fc, no greater than 2,500 pounds per square inch (psi) (17.2 Mpa)
regardless of the compressive strength specified in the construction documents
or used in the footing construction.

3. Nonstructural concrete slabs supported directly on the ground, including prestressed slabs
on grade, where the effective prestress in the concrete is less than 150 psi (1.03 Mpa).

4. Concrete patios, driveways and sidewalks, on grade.

12100-0001\1644828v3.doc 8



Table 1705.3, Iltems 3 AND 4, are amended to read as follows:

TABLE 1705.3
REQUIRED VERIFSCATION AND INSPECTION OF CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION
VERIFICATION AND CONTINUOUS | PERIODIC REFERENCE 18C
INSPECTION STANDARD" REFERENCE
3. Inspection of anchors cast in
concrete where allowable X ACI 318: D.9.2 1908.5,
loads have been increased or N

where strength design is used.

4. Inspection of anchors post-
installed in hardened concrete
members™ ACl 318:D0.9.2.4
a. Adhesive anchors
installed in horizontally X
or upwardly inclined
orientations 1o resist ACi318:D.8.2
sustained tension X
ioads. T
b. Mechanical anchors

and adhesive anchors
not defined in 4.2,

b. Specific requirements for special Inspection shall be inciuded In the ressarch report for the ancher issued by an approved
source in accordance with ACI 355.2 D.9.2 In ACH 318, or other qualification procedures. Where specific requirements are not
provided, special inspection requirements shall be specified by the reglstered design professional and shall be approved by the
building official prior to the commencement of the wark.

(Portions of table not shown remain unchanged.)
Section 1705.11 is amended to read as follows:

1705.11 Speclal inspections for seismic resistance.

Special inspections itemized in Sections 1705.11.1 through 1705.11.8, unless exempted by the
exceptions of Section 1704.2, are required for the following:

1. The seismic force-resisting systems in structures assigned 1o Seismic Design Category
C, D, E or F in accordance with Sections 1705.11.1 through 1705.11.3, as applicable.

2. Designated seismic systems in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D, E
or F in accordance with Section 1705.11.4,

3. Architectural, mechanical and electrical components in accordance with Sections
1705.11.5 and 1705.11.6.

4. Storage racks in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F in
accordance with Section 1705.11.7.

5. Seismic isolation systems in accardance with Section 1705.11.8.

Exception: Special inspections ilemized in Sections 1705.11.1 through 1705.11.8 are not
required for structures designed and construcied in accordance with one of the following:

12100-000111644828v3.doc 9



1. The structure consists of light-frame construction; the design speciral response
acceleration at short pericds, Spg, as determined in Section 161 3.3.4, does not exceed
0.5; and the building height of the structure does not exceed 35 fest (1C 668 mm)

2.  The seismic force-resisting system of the structure consists of reinforced masonry or
reinforced concrete; the design spectral response acceleration at short periods, Sps, as
determined in Section 1613.3.4, does not exceed 0.5; and the building height of the
structure does not exceed 25 feet (7620 mm)

3. The structure is a detached one- or two-family dwelling not excesding two stories above

grade plane, is not assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F and does not have

any of the following horizontal or vertical irregularities in accordance with Section 12.3 of
ASCE 7:

3.1 Torsional or extreme torsional irregularity.
3.2 Nonparaliel systems irregularity.
3.3 Siiiness-soft story or stiffness-extreme soft story irregularity.

3.4  Discontinuity in lateral strength-weak story irregularity.

Section 1711.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

1711.1.1 General.

The vertical load-bearing capacity, torsional moment capacity and deflection characteristics of
joist hangers shall be determined in accordance with ASTM D 1761 and ASTM D 7147_as

specified below using lumber having a specific gravity of 0.4¢ or greater, but not greater than
0.55, as determined in accordance with AF&PA NDS for the joist and headers.

Exception: The joist length shall not be required to exceed 24 inches (610 mm).

Section 1711.1.2 is amended to read as follows:

Ceorified to be
y rue copy of
1 QOCUMma -I?
| flein my
=

=S

1711.1.2 Vertical load capacity for [olst hangers.

The vertical ioad-bearing capagity for the joist hanger shall be determined by testing a minimum

| of three joist hanger assemblies as specified in ASTM D 1761 or ASTM D 7147. if the ultimate

vertical load for any one of the tests varies mora than 20 percent from the average ultimate
vertical load, at least three additional tests shall be conducted. The allowable vertical load-
bearing of the joist hanger shall be the lowest value determined from the following:

1. The lowest ultimate vertical load for a single hanger from any test divided by three
(where three tests are conducted and each ultimate vertical load does not vary more than 20
percent from the average ultimate vertical load).

2. The average ultimate vertical load for a single hanger from all tests divided by three
(where six or more tests are conducted).

3. The average from all tests of the vertical loads that produce a vertical movement of
the joist with respect 1o the header of 1/8 inch (3.2 mm).

12100-0001\1644828v3.doc 10



4. The sum of the allowable design loads for nails or other fasteners utilized to secure
the joist hanger to the wood members and aflowable bearing loads that contribute to the
capacity of the hanger.

5. The allowable design load for the wood members forming the connection.

Chapter 35 is amended by revising the following Standard Reference Numbers for ASTM to read as
follows:

D 1761-88(2000) &1 Test Method for Mechanical Fasteners in Wood 1711.1.1
171112

171113

D 7147-05 Standard Specification for Testing and Establishing 1711.11
Allowable Loads of Joist Hangers 1711.1.2

Section 1807.1.4 is amended to read as follows:
1807.1.4 Permanent wood foundation systems.

Permanent wood foundation systems shall be designed and installed in accordance with AF&PA
PWF. Lumber and plywood shall be treated in accordance with AWPA U1l (Commodity
Specification A, Use Category 4B and Section 5.2) and shall be identified in accordance with
Section 2303.1.8.1. Permanent wood foundation systems shall not be used for structures
assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Section 1807.1.6 is amended to read as foilows:

1807.1.6 Prescriptive design of concrete and masonry foundation walls.
Concrete and masonry foundation walls that are laterally supported at the top and bottom shall be
permitted to be designed and constructed in accordance with this section. Prescriptive design of
foundation walls shall not be used for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Section 1809.3 is amended to read as follows:;

1809.3 Stepped footings.

The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of footings shali be permitted to
have a slope not exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (10-percent stope). Footings
shall be stepped where it is necessary to change the elevation of the top surface of the footing or
where the surface of the ground slopes more than one unit vertical In 10 units horizontal (10-
percent slope}.

For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F, the stepping requirement shall
also apply to the top surface of grade beams supporting walls. Footings shall be reinforced with

four No. 4 rebar. Two bars shall be place at the top and bottom of the footings as shown in Figure
1809.3.

12100-0001\1644828v3.doc 11



STEPPED FOUNDATIONS

FIGURE 1809.3
STEPPED FOOTING

Section 1809.7 and Table 1809.7 are amended to read as follows:

1809.7 Prescriptive footings for light-frame construction.
Where a specific design is not provided, concrete or masonty-unit footings supporting walls of
fight-frame construction shall be permitted to be designed in accordance with Table 1809.7.
Prescriptive footings in Table 1809.7 shall not exceed one story above grade plane for structures
assigned to Seismic Design Category D, Eor F.

TABLE 1800.7
PRESCRIPTIVE FOOTINGS SUPPORTING WALLS OF

LIGHT-FRAME CONSTRUCTION b = &¢
NUMBER OF FLOORS SUPPORTED WIDTH OF FOOTING THICKNESS OF
BY THE FOOTING {Inches) FOOTING (Inches)
1 12 6
2 15 6
3 18 a9

For Sl: 1 inch = 25.4 mm_ 1 foot = 304.8 mm

a. Depih of lootings shall be in accordance with Section 1806.4,

b.  The ground under the floor shall be permittsd to be excavated ko the alevation of the top of tha footing.

c. |

d.  See Section 1908 for additional requirements for concrete footings of structures assigned to Selsmic Design
Category C, D, Eof F,

e For thickness of foundation walls, see Section 1807.1.6.

f.

Foatings shall be permitted to support a roof addition to the stipulated numbser of floore. Foolings supporting roof
only shall be as required for supporting one floor

12100-000111644528v3.doc 12



Section 1809.12 is amended to read as foliows:

1809.12 Timber footings.

Timber footings shall be permitted for buildings of Type V construction and as otherwise
approved by the building official. Such footings shall be treated in accordance with AWPA U3
(Commadity Specification A, Use Category 4B). Treated timbers are not required where placed
entirely below permanent water level, or where used as capping for wood piles that project above
the water level over submerged or marsh lands. The compressive stresses perpendicular to grain
in untreated timber footing supported upen ftreated piles shall not exceed 70 percent of the
allowable stresses for the species and grade of timber as specified in the AFAPA NDS. Timber
footings shall not be used in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Section 1810.3.2.4 is amended 1o read as follows:

1810.3.2.4 Timber.

Timber deep foundation elements shall be designed as piles or poles in accordance with AF&PA
NDS. Round timber elements shall conform to ASTM D 25. Sawn timber elements shall conform to
DOC PS-20. Timber shall not be used in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Section 1905.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

1805.1.3 ACI 318, Section 21.4.

Modify ACI 318, Section 21.4, by renumbering Section 21.4.3 to become 21.4.4 and adding new
Sections 21.4.3, 21.4.5, 21.4.6 and 21.4.7 to read as follows:

21.4.3 — Connections that are designed to yield shall be capable of maintaining 80 percent of

their design strength at the deformation induced by the design displacement or shail use Type 2
mechanical splices.

21.4.4 - Elements of the connection that are not designed to yield shall develop at least 1.5 S,

21.4.5 —In structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F, intermediate precast wall
panels and wall piers shall be designed in accordance with Section 21.9 or 21.13,

21.4.6 — Wall piers not designed as part of a moment frame in buildings assigned to Seismic
Design Calegory C shall have transverse reinforcement designed lo resist the shear forces
determined from 21.3.3. Spacing of transverse reinforcement shall not exceed 8 inches (203

mmj}. Transverse reinforcement shall be extended beyond the pier clear height for at least 12
inches (305 mm).

Exceptions:

1. Wall piers that satisfy 21.13,

be 2. Wall piers along a wall line within a story where other shear wall segments provide
fateral support to the wall plers and such segments have a total stifiness of at least
six times the sum of the stiffnesses of all the wall piers.

21.4.7 — Wall segments with a horizontal length-to-thickness ratio less than 2.5 shall be designed
as columns,

S S

12100-000111644828+3.doc 13



tobe

my

Section 1905.1.8 is amended to read as follows:
1905.1.8 ACI 318, Section 22.10.
Delete ACI 318, Section 22.10, and replace with the following:
22.10 - Plain concrete in structures assigned fo Seismic Design Calegory C, D, E or F.

22.10.1 - Structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D, E or F shall not have elements
of structural plain concrete, except as follows:

(8} Isolated footings of plain concrete supporting pedestals or columns are permitted,
provided the projection of the footing beyond the face of the supported member does not
exceed the footing thickness.

{c} Piain concrete footings supporting walls are permitted provided the footings have at least
two continuous longitudinal reinforcing bars, Bars shall nof be smaller than No, 4 and
shall have a total area of not less than 0.002 times the gross cross-sectional area of the
footing. A minimum of one bar shall be provided at the fop and bottom of the fooling.
Continuity of reinforcement shall be provided at comers and intersections.

Section 1905.1 is amended and Sections 1905.1.10 through 1905.1.12 are added to read as follows:
1905.1 General.

The text of ACI 318 shall be medified as indicated in Sections 1905.1.1 through 1905.1.12.
1905.1.10 ACI 318, Section 21.6.4.

Madify ACI 318, Section 21.6.4, by adding Sections 21.6.4.8 and 12.6.4.9 as follows:

21.6.4.8 Where the calculated point of contrafiexure is not within the middle half of the member
clear height, provide transverse reinforcement as specified in AC! 318 Sections 21 .6.4.1, ltems
(&) through (c), over the full height of the member,

21.6.4.9 — At any section where the design strength, pP,, of the column is less than the sum of
the shears V, computed in accordance with AC! 318 Sections 21.5.4.1 and 21.6.5.1 for all the
beams framing into the column above the leve! under consideration, transverse reinforcement as
specified in AC! 318 Ssctions 21.6.4.1 through 21.6.4.3 shall be provided. For beams framing into
opposite sides of the column, the moment components are permitied to be assumed to be of

| opposile sign. For the determination of the design strength, gF,, of the column, these moments

| are permitted to be assumed to result from the deformation of the frame int any one principal axis.

| 1905.1.11 ACI 318, Section 21.9.4.
|Modify ACI 318, Section 21.9.4, by adding Section 21.9.4.6 as follows:
21.9.4.6 — Walls and portions of walls with P, > 0.35F, shall not be consiclered to contribute to the

calculated shear strength of the structure for resisting earthquake-induced forces. Such walls
shall conform to the requirements of ACI 318 Section 21.13.

H

|

!’?100-0001\1644828v3.doc 14



d to be

my

1905.1.12 AC1 318, Section 21.11.6.
Modify ACI 318, by adding Section 21.11.6.1 as follows:

21.11.6.1 Collector and boundary elements in topping siabs placed over precast floor and roof
elements shall not be less than 3 inches (76 mm) or 8 d, in thickness, where d, is the diameter of
the largest reinforcement in the topping slab.

Section 2304.9.1 is amended to read as follows:

2304.9.1 Fastener requirements.
Connections for wood members shall be designed in accordance with the appropriate
methodology in Section 2301.2. The number and size of fasteners connecting wood members
shall not be less than that set forth in Table 2304.9.1._Staple fasteners in Table 2304.9.1 shall not

be used to resist or transfer seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D,
EorF.

Exception: Staples may be used to resist or transfer seismic forces when the allowable shear
values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the building official.

Section 2304.11.7 is amended to read as follows:

2304.11.7 Wood used In retaining walls and cribs.
Wood Installed in retaining or crib walls shall be preservative treated in accordance with AWPA
U1 {Commodity Specifications A or F) for soit and fresh water use. Wood shall not be used in
retaining or crib walls for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Section 2305.4 is amended to read as follows:

2305.4 Quality of Nalls.
In Seismic Design Category D, E or F, mechanically driven nails used in wood structural panel
shear walls shall meet the same dimensions as that required for hand-driven nails, including
diameter, minimum length and minimum head diameter. Clipped head or box nails are not
permitted in new construction. The allowable design value for clipped head nails in existing

construction may be taken at no more than the nail-head-area ratio of that of the same size hand-
driven nails.

Section 2305.5 is added 1o read as follows:

2305.5 Hold-down connectors,

In Seismic Design Category D, E or F, hold-down connectors shall be designed to resist shear
wall overturning moments using approved cyclic load values or 75 percent of the allowable
seismic load values that do not consider cyclic loading of the product. Connector bolts into wood
framing shall require steel plate washers on the post on the opposite side of the anchorage
device. Plate size shall be a minimum of 0.229 inch by 3 inches by 3 inches (5.82 mm by 76 mm
by 76 mm) in size. Hoid-down connectors shall be tightened to finger tight plus one haff (1/2)
wrench turn just prior to covering the wall framing.

Section 2306.2 is amended to read as follows:

2306.2 Wood-frame diaphragms.
Wood-frame diaphragms shali be designed and constructed in accordance with AF&PA SDPWS.
Where panels are fastened to framing members with staples, requirements and limitations of
AF&PA SDPWS shall be met and the allowable shear values set forth in Table 2306.2(1) or
2306.2(2) shall only be permitted for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category A, B, or C.

12500-000141644828v3.doc 15



Exception: Allowable shear values where panels are fastened to framing members with staples

may be used if such values are substantiated by cyclic lesting and approved by the building
official.

The allowable shear values in Tables 2306.2(1) and 2306.2(2) are permitted to be increased 40
percent for wind design.

Exception: [DSA-S8, DSA-SS/CC and OSHPD 1, 2 &4] Wood structural panel diaphragms using
staples as fasteners are not permitted by DSA and OSHFD.

Wood structural panel diaphragms used to resist seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic
Design Category D, E or £ shall be applied directly to the framing members.

Exception: Wood structural panel diaphragms are permitted to be fastened over solid lumber
planking or laminated decking, provided the pansl joints and lumber planking or laminated
decking joints do not coincide.

Bection 2306.3 of is amended and Section 2307.2 is added 1o read as follows:

2306.3 Wood-frame shear walls.

Wood-frame shear walls shall be designed and constructed in accordance with AF&PA SDPWS,

For structures assigned lo Seismic Design Category D, E, or F, Application of Tables 4.3A and
4.3B of AF&PA SDPWS shall include the following:

1. Wood structural panel thickness for shear walls shall not be less than 3/8 inch thick and studs
shall not be spaced at more than 16 inches on center.

2. The maximum nominal unit shear capacities for 3/8 inch wood structural panels resisting
seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F is 400 pounds
per linear foot (pif).

Exception: Other nominal unit shear capacities may be pemmitted if such values are
substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the building official.

3. Where shear design values using allow siress design (ASD) exceed 350 pif or load and
resistance factor design (LRFD) exceed 500 plf, all framing members receiving edge nailing
from abutting panets shall not be less than a single 3-inch nominal member, or two 2-inch
nominal members fastened together in accordance with Section 2306.1 to transfer the design
shear value between framing members. Wood structural panel joint and sill plate nailing shail
be staggered at all panel edges. See Section 4.3.6.1 and 4.3.6.4.3 of AF&PA SDPWS for sill
plate size and anchorage requirements.

4. Nails shall be placed not less than 1/2 inch in from the panel edges and not less than 3/8 inch
from the edge of the connecting members for shear greater than 350 pif using ASD or 500 pif
using LRFD. Nails shall be placed not less than 3/8 inch from panel edges and not less than
1/4 inch from the edge of the connecting members for shears of 350 pif or less using ASD or
500 plf or less using LRFD.

5. Table 4.3B application is not allowed for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D,
E orfF.

For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, application of Table 4.3C of AFAPA
SDPWS shall not be used below the top level in a multi-level building for structures.

12100-000111644828v3.doc 16



Where panels are fastened to framing members with staples, requirements and limitations of
AF&PA SDPWS shall be met and the allowable shear values set forth in Table 23086.3(1),
2306.3(2) or 2306.3(3) shall only be parmitted for structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category A, B, or C,

Exception: Allowable shear values where panels are fastened to framing members with staples

may be used if such values are substanliated by cyclic testing and approved by the building
official.

The allowable shear vaiues in Tables 2306.3(1) and 2306.3(2) are permitted to be increased 40
percent tor wind design. Panels complying with ANSI/APA PRP-210 shall be permitted to use
design values for Plywood Siding in the AF&PA SDPWS,

Exceptlon: {DSA-SS 7DSA-SS/CC and OSHPD 1, 2 &4] Wood structural pane! shear walls
using staples as fasteners are not permitted by DSA and OSHPD.

2307.2 Wood-frame shear walls. Wood-frame shear walls shall be designed and constructed in
accordance with Section 2306.3 as applicable.

Section 2308.3.4 is amended to read as follows:

2308.3.4 Braced wall line suppaort,

Braced wall lines shall be supported by continuous foundations.

Exception: For structures with a maximum plan dimension not over 50 feet (15240 mm),
continuous foundations are required at exterior walls only for structures assigned to Seismic
Design Category A, B, or C.

Section 2308.9.3.1, Section 2308.9.3.2 and Figure 2308.9.3.2 are amended to read as follows:
2308.9.3.1 Alternative bracing.

Any bracing required by Section 2308.9.3 is permitted to be replaced by the following:

1. In one-story buildings, each panel shall have a length of not less than 2 feet 8 inches (813
mm} and a height of not mere than 10 feet (3048 mm). Each panel shall be sheathed on one
face with 3/8-inch-minimum-thickness (9.5 mm) wood structural panel sheathing nailed with
8d common or galvanized box nails in accordance with Table 2304.9.1 and blocked at wood
structural panel edges. For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D or E, each
panel shall be sheathed on one face with 15/32-inch-minimum-thickness (11.9 mm) wood
structural panel sheathing nailed with 8d common nails spaced 3 inches on panel edges, 3
inches at intermediate supports. Two anchor bolts installed in accordance with Section
2308.6 shall be provided in each panel. Anchor bolts shall be placed at each panel outside
quarler paints. Each panel end stud shall have a tie-down device fastened to the foundation,
capable of providing an approved uplift capacity of not less than 1,800 pounds (8006 N). The
tie-down device shall be installed in accordance with the manufaciurer's recommendations.
The panels shall be supported directly on a foundation or on floor framing supported directly
on a foundation that is continuous across the entire length of the braced wall line. This
foundation shall be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom.

Where the continuous foundation is required to have a depth greater than 12 inches (305
mmy}, a minimum 12-inch by 12-inch (305 mm by 305 mm) continuous footing or turned down
slab edge is permitted at door openings in the braced wall line. This continuous footing or
turned down slab edge shall be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom.
This reinforcement shall be lapped 15 inches (381 mm) with the reinforcement required in the
continuous foundation located directly under the braced wall line.

12100-000111644828v3.doc 17



2.

In the first story of two-story buildings, each wall panel shall be braced in accordance with
Section 2308.9.3.1, item 1, except that the waod structural panel sheathing shafl be provided
on both faces, three anchor bolts shall be placed at one-quarter points, and tie-down device
uplift capacity shall nat be less than 3,000 pounds (13 344 N).

2308.9.3.2 Alternate bracing wall panet adjacent 0 a door or window opening.

121

Any bracing required by Section 2308.9.3 is permitted to be replaced by the following when
used adjacent to a door or window opening with a full-length header:

In one-story buildings, each panel shall have a length of not less than 16 inches (406 mm)
and a height of not more than 10 feet (3048 mm). Each panel shall be sheathed on one face
with a single layer of 3/8 inch (9.5 mm) minimum thickness wood structural panel sheathing
nailed with 8d common or galvanized box nails in accordance with Figure 2308.9.3.2. For
structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D or E, each panet shall be sheathed on one
face with 15/32-inch-minimum-thickness (11.9 mm) wood structural panel sheathing nailed
with 8d common nails spaced 3 inches on panel edges, 3 inches at intermediate supports
and in accordance with Figure 2308.9.3.2. The wood structural panet sheathing shall extend
up over the solid sawn or glued-laminated header and shall be nailed in accordance with
Figure 2308.9.3.2. A buill-up header consisting of at lsast two 2 x 12s and fastened in
accordance with ltem 24 of Table 2304.9.1 shall be permitted to be used. A spacer, if used,
shall be placed on the side of the buitt-up beam opposite the wood structural panel sheathing.
The header shall extend between the inside faces of the first {ull-length outer studs of each
panel. The clear span of the header between the inner studs of each panel shall be not less
than 6 feet (1829 mm) and not more than 18 feet (5486 mm) in length. A strap with an uplift
capacity of not less than 1,000 pounds (4,400 N) shall fasten the header to the inner studs
opposite the sheathing. One anchor bolt not less than 5/8 inch (15.9 mm) diameter and
installed in accordance with Section 2308.6 shall be provided in the center of each sill plate.
The studs at each end of the panel shall have a tie-down device fastened to the foundation
with an uplift capacity of not less than 4,200 pounds (18 480 N).

Where a panel is located on one side of the opening, the header shall extend between the
inside face of the first full-length stud of the panel and the bearing studs at the other end of
the opening. A strap with an uplift capacity of not iess than 1,000 pounds (4400 N) shall
fasten the header 1o the bearing studs. The bearing studs shalt aiso have a tie-down device
fastened to the foundation with an uplift capacity of not less than 1,000 pounds (4400 N).

The tie-down devices shall be an embedded strap type, installed in accordance with the
manufacturer's recornmendations. The panels shall be supported directly on a foundation that
is continuous across the entire length of the braced wall line. This foundation shall be
reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom.

Where the continuous foundation is required to have a depth greater than 12 inches (305
mm}, a minimum 12-inch by 12-inch (305 mm by 305 mm) continuous footing or turned down
slab edge is permitted al door openings in the braced wall line. This continuous footing or
tumed down slab edge shall be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom,
This reinforcement shall be lapped not less than 15 inches (381 mm) with the reinforcement
required in the continuous foundation located directly under the braced wall line.

In the first story of two-story buildings, each wall panel shalt be braced in accordance with

ltem 1 above, except that each panel shall have a length of not less than 24 inches (610
mmj.

111644828v3.doc 18



Table 2308.12.4 is amended to read as follows:

TABLE 2308.12.4
WALL BRACING IN SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORIES D AND E
{Minimum Percentage of Wall Bracing per each Braced Wall Line ™)

CONDITION | SHEATHING TYPE" Sps < 0.50 0.5058p5<0.75 | 0.7558p351.00 | Sps>1.00

]
One Story G-P 43 59 75 100

s-we 21 32 37 48

For Sl: 1 inch =25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

a.  Minimum length of panel bracing of one face of the wall for 5-W sheathing shall be at least 4'-0° long or both faces of the
wall for G-P sheathing shall be at least 8-0" long; h/w ratio shall not exceed 2:1. For S-W panel bracing of the same
material on two faces of the wall, the minimum length is permitted to ba one-half the tabulated value but the hw ratio shall
not excead 2:1 and design for uplift Is required. The 2:1 hiw ratio limitation does not apply to altemate braced wall pansls
constructed In accordance with Section 2308.9.3.1 or 2308.9.3.2. Wall framing to which sheathing used for braging is
applied shall be nominat 2 Inch wide [actual 1172 inch (38 mm)] or farger members and spaced a maximum of 16 inches
on canter. Braced wail panel construction types shall not be mixed within a braced wall line,

b.  G-P = gypsum board, poriland cement piaster or gypsum sheathing boards; S-W = wood structural panals

¢.  Nalling as specified below shall occur at alt panel edges at studs, at top and bottom plates and, where occuring, at
blocking:

Far 1/2-inch gypsum board, 5d (0.113 inch diameter) cooler nails at 7 inches on center;
For 5/8-inch gypsum board, N¢ 11 gage (0.120 inch diameter) cooler nails at 7 inches on center;
For gypsum sheathing board, 1-3/4 Inches lang by 7/16-inch head, diamond point galvanized nails at 4 inches on centar;
For gypsum iath, No. 13 gage (0.092 inch) by 1-1/8 inches long, 19/64-inch head, plasterboard at 5 inches on center;
For Portland cemant plaster, No. 11 gage (0.120 Inch) by 1%/ inches long, Ty~ Inch head at 6 inches on centar,

d.  S-W sheathing shall be a minimum of 15/32" thick nalled with 8d common placed /8 inches from panel edges and
spaced not more than 6 inches on center and 12 inches on canter along intermadiate framing members.

Section 2308.12.5 is amended to read as follows:

2308.12.5 Attachment of sheathing.
Fastening of braced wall panel sheathing shall not be less than that prescribed in Table
2308.12.4 or 2304.9.1. Wall sheathing shall not be attached to framing members by adhesives.

Staple fasteners in Table 2304.9.1 shall not be used to resist or transfer seismic forces in
structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Exception: Stapies may be used 1o resist or transfer seismic forces when the allowable
shear values are subsiantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the buiiding official.

All braced wall panels shall extend 1o the roof sheathing and shall be attached to paralle! roof
rafters or blocking above with framing clips (18 gauge minimum) spaced at maximum 24 inches
(6096 mm) on center with four 8d nails per leg (total eight 8d nails per clip). Braced wall panels
shall be laterally braced at each top comer and at maximum 24 inches (6096 mm) intervals along
the top plate of discontinuous vertical framing.

SECTION 3. Chapter 9.03 of Title 9 of the Manhaftan Beach Municipa! Code is amended to
read as follows:

Chapter 9.03 RESIDENTIAL CODE
9.03.01¢ Adoption of California Residentlal Code.

Pursuant 1o the provisions of Section 50022.1 1o 50022.10, inclusive, of the Government Code of the
ertifisd to be State and subject to the particular additions, deletions and amendments set forth In this chapter, the
rules, regulations, provisions and conditions set forth in that certain Code entitled *California
tru Residential Code 2013 Edition,” including Chapter 1, Division 2 and Appendix G therein contained,

promulgated and published by the Internaticnal Code Council and the California Building Standards
nmy

—:: f 12100-0001\1644828v3.doc 19



AT e
Certified to be
a trua copy «
r (JI- .. 1]
fica

DS

Commission, one (1) full printed copy of which, printed as a Code in book form were by the Council
ordered filed and which have been filed in the office of the City Clerk, oxpressly incorporated herein
and made a part hereof as fully and for all intents and purposes as set forth herein at length, are
hereby established and adopted as the rules, regulations, and provisions and conditions to be
observed and followed in the construction, enlargement, alleration, movement, replacement, repair,
equipment, use and occupancy, location, removal and demolition, conversion, use, height, area and
maintenance of buildings, structures and improvements of every detached one-and two-family
dwelling, townhouse not more than three stories above grade plane in height with a separate means
of egress and structures accessory thereto in the city and related subjects, items and matters as sel
forth in said Code, within the City. Subject to the additions, deletions and amendments set forth in
this chapter, said Code, with its said Chapter 1, Division 2 and Appendix G , is hereby established
and adopted by reference, and the same shall be designated, known and referred to as the
“Residential Code” of and for the City.

9.03.020 Work exempt from permit.
R105.2, item 2 is amended to read as follows:
2. Fences not over § feet (1829 mm) high.
R105.2, item 7 is amended to read as follows:

7. Prefabricated swimming pools that are less than 18 inches (457 mm) deep.

9.03.030 Expiration of plan review.
Section R105.3.2 is amended as follows:

Section R105.3.2 Time limitation of application. Applications for which no permit is issued within
180 days following the date of application shall expire by limitation and plans and other data
submitied for review may thereafter be retumed to the applicant or destroyed by the Building Official.
The Building Official may extend the time for action by applicant for a period not exceeding 180 days
upon written request by the applicant and justifiable cause demonstrated. No application shall be
extended more than once. In order 1o renew action on an application after expiration, the applicant
shall resubmit plans and pay a new plan review fee and plans shall be reviewad under the current
codes and ordinances at the time of the new applications.

9.03.040 Permit Explration.
Section R105.5 is amended to read as follows:

R105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized
by such permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work authorized by such
permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 days after the work is commenced, or if the

buitding or work authorized by such permit is not completed within 2 calendar years from the issuance
date of the permit.

| Before such work can be recommenced, a new permit, or a renewed permit as specified below, shali

be first obtained. No permit shall be renewed more than once.

For permits where work has not commenced within 180 days from the date of such permit, a renewed
permit may be obtained provided that: (1) no changes have been made or will be raguired in the

12100-0001\1644828v3.doc 20



original pians and specifications for such work; and (2) the expiration has not exceeded two years
from the original issuance date.

For permits where work had commenced and was subsequently suspended or abandoned for a
period exceeding 180 days, & renewed permit may be obtained provided that: (1) No changes have
been made or will be required in the original plans and specifications for such work; and (2} the
expiration has not exceeded two years from the issuance date and/or (3) Where construction has
progressed and has been approved o the point whereby only a final inspection(s) is required, a fee
shall be determined based on the number of estimated inspections, estimated staff time, and required
meetings as determined by the Building Official.

For permits that have exceeded two years beyond the issuance date, a new permit is required. The
applicant shall pay the fee based on the valuation of the uncompleled work required for a ptan check

and a new permit and plans will be reviewed under the current codes and ordinances at the time of
the new applications.

Any permittee holding an unexpired permit may apply for an extension of the time within which work
under that permit may be continued when, for good and satisfactory reasons, the permittee is unable
to continue work within the time required by this section. The Building Cfficial may axtend the time for
action by the permittee for a period not exceeding six calendar months upon written request by the
permittse showing that circumstances beyond the control of the permittee have prevenied action from
being taken. No permit shall be extended more than once.

if the owner or applicant fails to complete the construction work within the time required, the Building
Official is authorized to obtain the abatement of any unsafe condition or nuisance created by such
incomplete work. The City Attorney is authorized 1o file an aclion for the abatement of any such
unsate condition or nuisance if required to do so by the Building Official,

9.03.050 Fees.
Section R108.2 is amended to read as follows:

R108.2 Schedule of permit fees. The less shall be determined by the most current City Resolution
of Fees.

Plan Review Fees. When submittal documenis are required by the building official, a plan review fee

shall be paid at the time of submitting the submittal documents for plan review. Said plan review fee
shall be determined by the most current City Resolution of Fees,

The pian review fees specified in this section are separate fees from the permil fees and are in
addition to the permit fees.

When submittal documents are incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan review or
when the project involves phased submittal items as defined in Section R106.3.3, an additional plan
review fee shall be charged as determined by the most current City Resolution of Fees.

Section R108.3 is amended to read as follows:

A108.3 Building permit valuations. The applicant for a permit shall provide an estimated permit
value at time of application. Building permit valuations shall include total value of the werk for which a
permit is being issued, such as electrical, gas, mechanical, plumbing equipment and other permanent
systems, including materials and labor. If, in the opinion of the building official, the valuation is
underestimated on the application, the permit shall be denied, unless the applicant can show detailed

estimates to meet the approval of the building officiat. Final building permit valuation shall be set by
the building official.

1210000011 644828v3.doc 219



SS

Section R108.6 is amended to read as foliows:

R108.6 Work commencing before permit Issuance. Any person who commences any work on a
building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system before obtaining the necessary
permits shall be subject to & fee established by the Building Official and the most current Manhattan
Beach Resolution of Fees in addition to the required permit fees.

Investigation. Whenever any work for which a permit is required by this code has been commenced

without first obtaining said permit, a special investigation shall be made before a permit may be
issued for such work.

Investigation Fee. An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shail be collected whether or not
a permit is then or subsequently issued. The investigation fee shall be equal up to the amount of the
permit fee required by this code as determined by the Building Official. The minimum investigation
fee shall be determined by the mast current Resolution of Fees. The paymant of such investigation

fee shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions of this code nor from any
penalty prescribed by law.

9.03.060 Violation penalties.
Section R113.4 is amended 1o read as follows:

Section R113.4. Violation penalties. Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, afters or repairs a building or
structure in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the building official, or of
a permit or ceriificate issued under the provisions of this cods, shall be subject to the penalties as
prescribed by law. Every person who willfully resists, delays, obstructs or interferes in any way with any
City Building Inspector in the discharge or attempt to discharge any duty of his or her office or
employment shall be guilty of a violation of this Chapter

Any person, firm, or corporation violating any of the provisions or failing to comply with any of the
mandatory requirements of the ordinances of Manhattan Beach shall be guilty of a misdemeancr.
Any person convicted of a misdemeanor under the ordinances of Manhattan Beach shall be punished
by a fine of not more than one thousand dollars ($1,000), or by imprisonment not to exceed six (6)
months, or by both such fine and imprisonment, Each such person shali be gullty of a separate
offense for each and every day during any portion of which any violation of any provision of the

ordinances of Manhattan Beach is committed, continued, or permitied by any such person, and shail
be punished accordingly.

9.03.070 Definltions.
Section R202 is amended by adding and deleting a definition as follows:
ADDITION. An extension or increase in floor area or height of a building or structure. Also, major

demolition which includes the removal of roof framing, interior and exterior walls for the purpose of

rebuilding with an increase in floor area, shall be considered a new building as determined by the
building official.

ATTIC, HABITABLE. This definition is deleted,

12]00-000111644828v3.doc 22



Section R301.1.3.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section R301.1.3.2 Woodirame structures.

The building official shall require construction documents to be approved and stamped by a Califoria
licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings of woodirame construction more than two stories and
basement in height located in Seismic Design Category A, B or C. Notwithstanding other sections of

law; the law establishing these provisions is found in Business and Professions Code Section 5537
and 6737.1.

The buiiding official shall require construction documents to be approved and stamped by a California
licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings of woodirame construction more than one story in
height or wilh a basement located in Seismic Design Categery Dg, D;, D, or E.

Table R301.2.2.1.1 and Section R301.2.2.1.2 are amended to read as follows:

TABLE R301.2.2.1.1
SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY DETERAMINATION

CALCULATED Sps SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY
Sps =0.17g A

0.17g < Sps $0.33g B

0.33g < Sps = 0.509 c

0.509 < Sps 5 0.67g Do

0.67g < Sps = 0.83g D,

0.83g < Sps = 1.00g D,
1.00g < Sps E

A301.2.2.1.2 Alternative determination of Seismic Design Category E.
Buildings located in Seismic Design Category E in accordance with Figure R301.2(2) are permitted to
be reclassified as being in Seismic Design Category D; provided one of the following is done:

1. A more detailed evaluation of the seismic design category is made in accordance with the
provisions and maps of the California Building Code. Buildings located in Seismic Design
Category E per Table R301.2.2.1.1, but located in Seismic Design Category D per the
California Building Code, may be designed using the Seismic Design Calegory D,
requirements of this code.

2. Buildings located in Seismic Design Category E that conform to the following additional
restrictions are permitted to be constructed in accordance with the provisions for Seismic
Design Category D» of this code:

2.1 All exterior shear wall lines or braced wall panels are in one plane verlically from the
foundation to the uppermost story.

2.2. Floors shall not cantilever past the exterior walls.

} 2.3.The bullding is within all of the requirements of Section R301.2.2.2 5 for being considered
as regular.

2.4.For buildings over one story in height, the calculated Sps shall not exceed 1.25g.

Section R301.2.2.2.5. tems 1, 3 and 5, are amended 1o read as follows:

{12100-000111644228v3 doc 23



R301.2.2.2.5 lrregular bulldings
1. When exterior shear wall lines or braced wall panels are not in one plane vertically from the
foundation to the uppermaost story in which they are required.

3. When the end of a braced wall panel occurs over an opening in the wall below
5. When portions of a floor level are vertically offset.
Section R301.2.2.3.8 is added to read as follows:

R301.2.2.3.8 Anchorage of mechanical, electrical, or plumbing components and equipment.
Mechanical, electrical, or plumbing components and equipment shall be anchored to the structure.
Anchorage of the components and equipment shall be designed to resist loads in accordance with the
International Building Code and ASCE 7, except where the compenent is positively attached to the
structure and flexible connections are provided between the component and associated ductwork,
piping, and conduit; and either

1. The component weighs 400 Ib {1,780 N} or less and has a esnter of mass located 4 fi (1.22
m} or tess above the supporting structure; or

2. The component weighs 20 Ib (89N) or less or, in the case of a distributed system, 5 Ibfft (73
N/m) or less.

Section R401.1 is amended to read as follows:

R401.1 Application.

The provisions of this chapter shall control the design and construction of the foundation and
foundation spaces for all buildings. In addition to the provisions of this chapter, the design and
construction of foundations in areas prone to flooding as established by Table R301.2(1) shall meet

the provisions of Section R322. Wood foundations shall be designed and installed in accordance with
AF&PA PWF.

Exception: The provisions of this chapter shall be permitted to be used for wood foundations only
in the following situations:

1. In buildings that have no more than two fioors and a roof.

2. When interior basement and foundation walls are constructed at intervals not exceeding
50 feet (15 240 mm).

Wood foundations in Seismic Design Category Dy, D or D, shall not be permitted.

Exceptlon: In non-occupied, single-story, detached storage sheds and similar uses other than
| carport or garage, provided the gross floor area does not exceed 200 square fest, the plate height
I does not exceed 12 feet in height above the grade piane at any point, and the maximum roof

projection does not exceed 24 inches.

1 iiections R403.1.2, R403.1.3 and R403.1.5 are amended to read as follows:

15403.1.2 Continuous footing in Selsmic Design Categories Dy, D, and D,.

The braced wall panels at exterior walis of buildings located in Seismic Design Categories Dy, D4 and
Pg shall be supported by continuous footings. All required interior braced wall panels in buildings shall
be supported by continuous footings.

12100-0001\1644828v3.doc 24



R403.1.3 Seismic reinforcing.

Concrete footings located in Seismic Design Calegories Dy, D, and D, as established in Table
R301.2(1), shall have minimum reinforcement. Botiom reinforcement shall be located a minimum of 3
inches (76 mm) clear from the bottom of the footing.

in Seismic Design Categories Dy, Dy and D, where construction joint is created between a concrete
footing and a stem wall, a minimum of one No. 4 bar shall be installed at not more than 4 fest (1219
mm} on cenler. The vertical bar shall extend to 3 inches (76 mm) clear of the bottom of the footing,
have a standard hook and extend a minimum of 14 inches (357 mm) into the stem wall.

In Seismic Design Categories Do, Dy and D, where a grouted masonry stem walk is supported on a
concrete footing and stem wall, a minimum of one No. 4 bar shall be installed at not more than 4 feet

(1219 mm) on center. The vertical bar shall extend to 3 inches (76 mm) clear of the bottom of the
footing and have a standard hook.

In Seismic Design Categories Do, Dy and D, masonry stem walls without solid grout and vertical
reinforcing are not permitted.

Exception: In detached one- and two-family dwellings located in Seismic Design Category A, B
or C which are three stories or less in height and constructed with stud bearing walls, isolated
plain conerete footings, supporting columns or pedestals are permitted.

R403.1.5 Slope. The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of footings shall be
permitted to have a slope not exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (10-percent slope).
Footings shall be stepped where it is necessary to change the elevation of the top surface of the

footing or where the surface of the ground slopes more than one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal
(10-percent slope).

For structures located in Seismic Design Categories Dg, D, or D, stepped footings shall be reinforced

with four No. 4 rebar. Two bars shall be place af the top and bottom of the footings as shown in
‘Figure R403.1.5,

RECOMMEND: 2> b
b2

AN
STEPPED FOUNDATIONS
) FIGURE F403.15

STEPPED FOOTING

(] 1\1644828v3.doc 25



Section R501.1 is amended to read as follows:;

R501.1 Application.

The provisions of this chapter shall control the design and construction of the floors for all buildings
including the floors of attic spaces used to house mechanical or plumbing fixtures and equipment.

Mechanical or plumbing fixtures and equipment shall be attached (or anchored) to the structure in
accordance with Section R301.2.2.3.8

Section R503.2.4 is added 1o read as follows:
R5(3.2.4 Openings in horlzontal diaphragms.

Openings in horizontal diaphragms with a dimension perpendicular to the joist that is greater than 4
{eet (1.2 m) shall be constructed in accordance with Figure R503.2.4.

PLYWOOD SHEATHING
DIAPHRAGM OPENING

METAL TIE 16GA. X1 1/2"x
WY 16164 COMMON NAILS

-OR-

METAL TIE 16GA. X | 122 x (OPENING WIDTH « 407} MINL,
@ TDTAL) W/ 24-180 COMMON NALS

#40° MIN., (4 TOTALY
AS SHOWN

Fai St: £ loch = 25.4 mm., 1 foot = 304.8 man.

Blockings shail be providad beyond headers.

{Matal ties not less than 0.058 inch {1.47 mm (18 galvanized gage)] by 1.5 inches (38 mm) wide with aight 16d common
{nalls on each side of the headar-joigt intersection. The metal ties shall have a minkmum yield of 33,000 ps| (227 MPa).
, fpenings In diaphragms shall be further limited in accordance with Section R301.2.2.2,5.

oH

0

s FIGURE R503.2.4
OPENINGS IN HORIZONTAL DIAPHRAGMS
- .,-,,,-q m bﬁ‘

opy of

|
Rty
m my I
|

1

12100-000111644828v3.doc 26



.;d-‘"?

tobe

SS

liems 37 and 38 of Table R602.3(1) are amended, and footnots K is added, to read as follows:

TABLE R802.3{{}—continued
FASTENER SCHEDULE FOR STRUCTURAL MEMBERS
SPACING OF FASTENERS
ITEM | OESCRIPTION OF BUILDING MATERIALS DESCAIPTION OF FASTENER™** Toges | intermadion suppori®®
{nches) (inches)
Wood structural panels, sublioor, roof and intetior wall shestsing 1o rming snd partich wall sheathing b framing
1 yay- 6d common (27 x 0.113") nail (subfloar wall)! P .
b2 8d commeon (2'/,” x §.131 ) oail (roofy’

33 P17 8d common naif (2'/,” x 0.1317) 3 3

Ijw_ b= 10d common (37 x 0.148”) nail or
34 U414, 8d (24, x 0,131} deformed nail 6 12

Othver wadl shasthing”
15 11" structural cellulosic 1'," galvanized roofing nail, /. crown ar 1° crown 3 P

ftberboard sheathing waple 16 ga, 1Y/,” long
Piy,* structorel ecllulosic ¥~ galvanized roafing nail, 7/, crown or 1" crown
ge fibcrboard sheathing suphe 16ga, 1L, long 2 L
" iy F 1'£,” galvanized roofing nail; staple galvanired,
i " gypoum sheathing? 1'; loug; 117, screws, Type W or S E L
' e . ¥/, galvanized roofing nail; smple galvanized,
e “” gypsura heathing? I’I:'lmg:]‘l,'mm'l'ypcw oS 4 U
Wood panals, dnati bl Y o faming

3y 6d deformed (27 % 0.1207 nail or
2 /" ond less 8d common (2,” x 0131 ) nail S i
Yo ge 8d common (2'," x 0,131} nail or 6 2

U 8d deformed (21, x 0.120) nail

e qipe 10d common (37 x 0.148*) nail or
. Vhr- 14, 8 deformed (27, 0,120 nail & ik

For Sk 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 mile per hoor = 0,447 avy: | K5 = 6.893 MPx.
a Al nails are th box or deft d shanks except where otherwise stated. Naik used For framing and shearhi ioers shall have mind

b.

everige bending yicld sirengihs as shown: 80 ksi for shank diameter of 0.192 inch (20¢ cammon nail), 90 ksi for shank dismeters larger thas 0. 142 inch bt
oot {arger than 0.177 inch, and 100 boi for shunk dizmeters of 0.142 inch or less.
Staples are 16 gage wiro and have a minimaw %,-doch 00 dikmesor crown width.

€. Nails shall be spaced M nox mor: than 6 inches an cedier a all supports where spans &re 42 inches or gresiar.
d. Fowr-foot by 8-foot or 4-foot by 9-foot pancls chall be applied vertically,

e.
£

-

Ix

5 of f not included ia this Gable thall be based on Table R602.3(2).
Fauqinmhvnqlmicwiadspeedn(lwqtoryulu.de@fwned(z'rz’xo.lm)n-kdnllhemd!wmingplywmdndwmdﬂnmmlml
xwhh-.lhiulnfnmm;wdnnmhﬁmm@hchdmﬁmpbhmdvdk,i[mnmd‘bdmhmﬂm?sfm,wtojsﬁamn'mm.

For tegrony having basic wind speed of 100 mph or less, oails for hing wood ] panel roof cheathing to gable end wall framing shail be spaced 6
incbeaonmMmhu:wmdspeedkmrlhnlmmﬂn.mhforumdﬁupmlmdmh;midemwdimwmm:hdlhmdﬁindmm
muhmhmﬁnhdhmfmddgu.umndnﬂemdwdk.md4mmmmpbleend~dlﬁmim

Gypwum sheathing shall confenn to ASTM C 1396 and shall be ibstalicd i accordace with GA. 253. Riberboard sh thing shall conform to ASTM C 208.
Spacing of fa on floor siwcathing pesict odges appliss 1o pane! edges sappored by framing bers and required blocking and of 21l floor perimeicrs
anly. Spacing of on rouf sheathing pancl edpes epplics o panc] edges supported by framing members and required hlocking, Blocking of raof or
floor sheathing pancl edges perpendicular 1o the framing members nesd not be provided except as requi d by other provisions of thia code. Floor perimerar
shall be supporsod by framing members or solid dlocking.

Whee o mifter i fastened to an adjent parallel ceiling joist in accordance with this schedule, provide two e nails oa one side of te mdter and toe nails
fmtheetdin;juiuwwpphleinmdmwid:mhnhdnkmmenulonlhnppuileﬁdeufuuﬂushllmbemﬁmd

K. Use of siagies In bvacad widl parsds shwlt be prohiblied in Seleric Dasign Categary DO, 09 _or O
—— e e I e pron ™ ed 1 et Laign Categary 00,01 or O,

Footnote “b” of Table R602.3(2) is amended to read as follows:

b.

Staples shall have a minimum crown width of 7/16-inch on diameter except as noted. Use of

staples in roof, floor, subfloor, and braced wall panels shall be prohibited in Seismic Design Category
Du, Dy, or D,.

12100-0001\1644828v3.doc 27



Table R602.10.3(3) Is amended to read as follows:

TABLE Rec2 106
BRACING REQUIREMENTE BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY
. &%m' 10 FEET MINILRLGL TOTAL LENGTH BRACED WALL P
L R D O LGAD PEQUIRED ALONE EAGH SHAt Rt e ANELS
- BRACED WALL LINE SPACING < 25 FEET
Braced Wall Methods Mathads
B Corce Biory Locstion Line Le Memodue' | uemodand| DNE.STR. | Method | o ey
{fost} HPE, m 4 8-
10 23 L s 3 4
2 10 50 50 32 27
@ @ 30 75 15 75 48 4l
e 40 100 100 100 64 54
50 125 125 125 20 68
10 3 rY; s 10 26
i NP 90 50 60 54
. only) @ @ 0 NP 135 135 90 77
40 NP 180 180 120 102
50 NP 2s 05 150 128
10 NP 0 60 45 38
20 NP 120 120 20 71
@ % NP (8.0 180 135 ns
a0 NP 240 240 120 153
50 NP 00 N0 s 191
10 NP 2#ip | 2t-58| 18 15
2 NP S50  Ss-110| 36 ad
@ ) NP 8368 -83-188| 54 48
é 10 NP Honp Hend 12 6l
0 NP Bes|  e-us| oo 71
10 52 3w | Sw| 3% 31
) NP 45w | josw | 75 64
D, @ @ 3 NP 58 | 58| 113 96
@ NP 0| aow| 150 s
50 NP 2630 | 263-w| 188 160
. 10 v T3-w| IFE | 33 3
m NP SR s | 108 90
@ ) NP 5w | 2tEe | 158 134
0 NP 20| 295 | 20 179
50 NP | 33w | %3 723
(continued)
Certified to be
a true copy of
gaid document
on flein my
ofiice.
City Ci
the C 1210G-0001\1644828v3.doc 28

M
B




TABLE RE02.10.3{3)—continued
BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SE)SMIC DESIGN CATEQGORY

City Clerk of

the City of
Manhattan
Beach

© WALL HEIGHT = 10 FEET
T S ST e s
+ BRACED WALL LINE SPACDIG < 26 FEET
| sercws | BRTR | varodis | wmesaat SR | Mot |
SFR*A
10 [ 35 50| 2460|210 7
20 NP S6-120f -6d120 40 34
@ @ 30 NP 58-180] 98180 60 51
e " NP 126-240 42ed 0 68
50 NP 450-300| 456308 100 85
1] b E= T L T8
b NP 26 Np] 2oNp 00 13
D, @ @ 0 NP 486 NP| de0NP| 125 s
@ NP 246 NP| 240.NP| 180 15
50 NP 268 NP| eanp| ns 19,5
0 i 35 fp| 5 np| 60 51
» NP +-NF|  d7enp| 120 102
) B 255 p| 2ssnp| 1m0 153
40 NP ate-NP| 348 NP| 240 04
0 NP s pp| 4aswe| 300 255
1w NP #8~gn —+0-8.0 25 21
n NP 868-160| -80-160 50 43
é @ ' NP -9 2enuy 13 4
e 40 NP H68-3200 0320 100 85
50 NP 200400 268400 125 106
o o F5-we | F5np| 53 a7
20 NP +58-NP | 45e-nNp| 110 94
é 3 NP 25 np| mENp[ 165 140
a0 P %8 Np| 300N 220 187
D 50 NP 315 NP | -394 NP ns 34
B 10 NP NP NP NP NP
on NP NP NP NP NP
@ £ NP NP NP NP NP
40 NP NP NP NP NP
50 NP NP NP NP NP
] P NP B 73 Yy
i 0 NP NP NP 150 123
Cripple 30 NP NP e ns 9.1
= yonelns) NP NP M 300 35
50 NP NP [5iid 375 kIR

For SL: 1 inch = 25.4 mm. | foot = 305 mm, | pound per square foo = 0:0479 kPa.

o Linear inerpotation shall be permitied.

. Wall bracimg bengihs ane based os a soil tite class “D.” Interpolation of bracing leagths between the S, valucs axtociated with the Seixmic Desigs Caiepofies
shall be peanitied when a site-specific S, value 15 deterssned in accurdance with Section 16123 of the Fwernational Buikding Code.

€, Method LIB chall bave ypsom boond (saensd 1o st kast onc side with sails or screws por Toble R602,3(1) for exsevior sheathing or Table R7023.5 for
interior gypsum board. Spacing of [25ieners ot pasel edges shall not exceet 8 iaches.

d. Mether CS-5F8 applics in SDC C only.

&, Methocls OB and PCP braced wall panal huw retic shall not exceed 1-1 in SDC DO, D1 or D2. Mathods DWE, SFB., PES, and HPS are not pramittad in SDC DO, 1,

sy

2100-00017\1544828v3.doc 29




Table R602.10.4 is amended to read as follows:

Sy

TABLE Re02.164
BRACING METHODS {
CONNECTION CRITERLA
METHOOS, MATERIAL | MEINIENM THICKNESS ROURE
1 % 4 wood o Wood; 2-8d commaon naits :’po:!‘dpuslmm
approved meital siraps of botiom plaxs
Lot boacing | 4% m&0° angles for m 3.8 (2Y," long x 0.113" dia.} nails
A Al maximm 16* Metal:
wind specing Metal sioaps per manufactrer por marufacturer
DWB % 'nnmin;‘l} for e 284 (2'," long x 0,113 din) nails
Diagonal marimum 24~ ; or Fer std
wopd boards stud spacing gl"”””m 2- [¥," long siaples
wsp £ common (2 420,131 nals “Etizversheathing per- 5 .
Wood B2 stonddace oo i Feble RARIGH Sye o ld
stctural panel e TR - | o ety pe
{See Serlion R64) 1502 S i LT D e bl 6531 or A543} :
2 odoe ciatanca io canel odos 6~ 12° field |
BV.AVEP
‘Wood Structuesl 4;mpaneluip
Panels with Siono %y - Iy - 12" a intermediate
or Masonsy Veseer Y See Figure R602,106.5 8d comnwon (2'4," x 0.131) npils supporis 47 a1 braced
(See Section will panel end posts
RG0210.6.5)
— 14,* long x 012" dia. (for ', thick
J S Yy or ¥y fos shcalking) P, loag x 012" dia
fibe sheail- maximem 167 {far g " thick sheathi 3" edges 6 field
a | fiberboard stod spacing = galvanired roofing nails or 8d common
g bt (2;" long % 0,131~ dia) nails
'E Nails or screves per Table R602.X 1) for [For alt draced wall
g S . m exterior locaticns panei locations: 7~
nd " 1" r edges (including top
Gypsum board ? Nails or acrews per Fahle RH2.2.5 for plales) 7
o= interior locations A0 byl 4
[2T) - B For ¥,=, &4 common
P ¥, oY " for L 4 .
Pantickeboard \ Lirio s o [l % (113" din} nailx o o
sheathing n:;mum_lﬁ m F;uhﬁl,".ldmm S SR
(Sea Scction R60S) pacing (2'," long % 0.131* cEa.) agils
=] See Section R203.6 for 1'," Woag, 11 gage, 7,,~dia bead nails |, o
Partlznd maximum 167 : o 0.c.00 all ioming
ocement plater stud spacing ’, bong, 16 gage stapies 2
HPS . : rs 0.002= din,, 0.235 din hend nnils with
Harghourd | "™ for mttimom 1 Jeogth 1o acoommedate 114~ 4° edpes B fickd
yanel siding Fpacing penziration fnto sinds
il y, See Section R602.106. | Sec
Alcmze ¥ 0. B
t 1 veal U Section R602.10.6.1

12100-000111644828v3.doc

(contimued)



*ML'M?";%. :
70 V8
(L, | H

. ."I
oa F
Ty A
240, M
i ot
—

oriified to be
ue copy of
« document
file in my
8,

Y

Clark of
City of

raltan

-
-

TABLE M1M—eonmrd
BRACING METHODS

a Adbust -+

of wall theats

Dexiyo Culegurios D, D, aad D, roof covering dead load may not exceed 3 pef.

€. Jampy openings djaent to & Method CS-0 pancl drall be provided

‘be permitted adjacent i 3 Method C5-0 paned.

CONNECTION CRITERA" il
METHODS, MATERIAL MINUUM THICKNESS RGURE
Fastaners Spacing
ME
Portal frame with ¥, I Soe Section 6021062 | See Soction RE02.10.6.2
3 toid-downs | Lt
E =
= l |
3 G . . »
E Portal frame  garage T See Section RAOZ.1063 | Sec Section R602.10.63
I I Sl common 2 {25019 00l Everiorshesthing por- : -
C3-WSP FablcR6I3 6" edges 12~ field
Cnmmmllyshmbed’ e !d ﬂ 1 H ! - - : -
wood stroctural paned | sy OHCONRG 71Nl | Eeriorshoathingpor Veries by -fascner
§ e = : L 6 edges 12-iekd —|
£ | Conlinnousty sheathed |
£ | wood stractura) pasel ES '@ | See Method CS-WsP See Method C5-WSP
2 adjacent to gatage 15m
g openings ) | }
é | csPY - e |
Continuously sheathed | g | l ( }[| Sec Section RE02.10.64 | Sec Section R6021064 |
g portai | 150z L ]
* = e — e =
5 | | V7 long %012 dia
8 | tfor',” thick sheathing)
cssrt oMo B for 1%~ Jong % 0,12~ dia.
Continuously sheatbed | meaximum 16° i 10 (for B¢, thick sheaibing) 3" udges 6 fickd
structaral fiberboard | stud spacing — galvanized roofing nails or 1
| 2d commoa I
1 i ] (2'/," tlong » 0,131~ &a.) nails |
For S 1 inch = 25.4 ma, 1 Foot = 308 mam, | degroe = 0075 fod, | posnd per squae fool = 47,8 NI, | mile por bour = 0,447 m,

g. inchadiag Muthad OB, shall ot be permitied in Seiasiic Desipn Caicgories C, D, D, snd D,

b. App!icsb]:meh»mbp:go&unpnin-hnupponialgd:lemdnuwmfhdndy.hmyui]beudmmwn.‘llol‘lllugmp. Ia Sciomic

wilh & Biader in socondance with Taiske R302 5(1). A full height clear opemag shall oot

d. Method C3-SFH docs not 2pply in Seimic Design Cateporics D, I and D, and i areas where the wind tpeed cxoecds 100 mph.

2 B0 PCP Draced wall paned

¢ Method apiplies 1o detached ona- sad two- family dwellings i Seismric Design Catcgorics D, ihmugh D,

12100-000111644828v3.doc

ondy.

3




Figure RB02.10.6.1 is amended to read as follows:

PANELLENGTHPER
TABLE ROZ 108

BRALED WALL PANEL HEIGHT

SN, 2 X4 FRAWING MM,
DOUBLE #TUDS REQUIRED.

2) HOLO-DOWN DR (2} STRAP-TYPE
ANCHORS PER TABLE RED210.41 (01
OF EAGH SHOWHR FOR CLARITY).
STRAP-TYPE ANCHORS SHALL BE
FERITTED TO 8E ATTACHED QVER
THE 1000 STRUCTURAL FAHEL

PANEL HUST HE ATTACHED
TO COMCRETE FOOTING OR
CONCRETE FOUNDATION
WALl CONTINUOUS OVER
BRACED WALL LINE

Certified to be
atrue copy of
said document
on file in my
office.

S5

City Clerk of

the City of
Manhattan
Beach

12100-000111644828+3.doc

12) W DIAMETER ANCHOR
BOLTS LOCATED BETWEEN
" AND 127 OF EACH END OF
THE SEGLUENT

FIGURE R602.10.6.1
METHOD ABW—ALTERNATE BRACED WALL PANEL

FOR PAMEL SPLICE (F NEEDED)
ADJOIHING PAHEL DG ES SHALL MEET
OVER AND 8E FASTENED TO OOMLi ON
FRAMING

80 COMMONOR-EALY-DEIENALE & §°
0.C. AT PAHEL EDGES. FOR SINGLE
STORY AND @ 4 0L, PANELEDGES
FORTHE FIRST OF 2 STORIES

ETUDS UHDER HEADER AS RECBIRED

20 COMHON-OR-CA-BON HALS @ 127
0.C. ATINFERIOR BUPPORTS

KM, REINF ORCING OF F OUMDATION,
OHE #4 BAR TOP AND BOTTOU. LAP
BARS 4E-HINKIUA.

i

HINBIUL FOOTING 9IZE LHDER
OPENING 19 12" X 2.

-OPENNGE—



Figure R602.10.6.2 is amended to read as follows:

oL XTENT OF HEADE R V11TH DOUELE PORTAL PRANE S (TWO BRALED YodlL PANELS

i+ ooty oty SN

2 FINLSHED WS TH OF OPEKE:E
FOR

HHGLE QR DOUNE MORTAL ~— "

TENL.ON STA AP P2 i=
TABLE RECL 108 0N
OPRDSITE SICE OF
y 1 SHEATHMGY -
@ A LE Al w E r-":';.:l-'i
Hiak)
il SR j@__.a"?‘ i 1 NERDED, PANTL 1 L
4 FASTEN SEEATHIRG TO HEADER WATA BD i i sty T M
i n DECUR CWER AltD B2
i COUMOK ORl QALVANZED BOXWALS H ¥ 98I | RARED B0 COHUON il
E FATTERN &S SHOYH BLOCKN ) WIT il MESDER 11T
; HEAGERTD 1ACK.ATUD STRAR PER TABLE bl o
Fl i RADZ1NA O BOTE BOAS OF OFENNG RONOFT. 0L ROWS OF 10
F I | ﬁ CPPOSITE $0£ OF SHEATHIIG HALIHD 1 REQUIRED - He'r el
§ 5 i i | mescuramLinee, —. i g )
o H
3 m“\-—- W I DOUBLE 2x4 PRAUNIG COVERED ¥ITH N, i T um patvoon
% 3 G 1507 MSTHICK WOOD STRUCTURAL PANES SHE ATHING TYPICAL PORTAL = 4 STRUCTURAL
= RN R ] WATH 50 COMN OM CR GALVARITED BOXNALE AT FRLAME CORSTRUCTION 1 PANEL
[T ped 0.6 WAL FRAMING ETUDS, BLOCKIS, AND “ii : BEATHIVG
SALE)TYP,
AT
Vi LENGTH SF PaREL PER TaBLE R292 105 |II SR-AUD-HAC K- ST
AUHDER SIS
M. @}4700 LB STRAPIYPE HOLDD OV Y of To ranH
(EUBEDDED MYD COMCRE TE AND N EHLED Wi T A
L) ‘.II
== Wi REGFORCIID OF FOUNGATION, DRE 48R |
g TOR AXD BOTTOM OF FUOTIMGD, LAP RARS 45 ! 3
e ] | GOUCAETE- MO
4 ~ TemeeSo—eeay ———————weT MG
~ Ninkeinteis r et |
—
M W FOOTIS SIZE UNOER ORLRING I8 12X 11" A TR
DOWN LA B4 A2 8F PERINTTES AT DOOR OPENMIOS.
NI, (1] B DWAUTETER ANCHOR SULS INETALLED #ER
Rab] 18 WTH T°X 1° K 118" MLA TR WD, SHER
FRONT ELEVATION SECTION
FIGURE R602.10.8.2

METHOD PFH-—PORTAL FRAME WITH HOLD-DOWNS
AT DETACHED GARAGE DOOR OPENINGS

diobe

nmy

SS

12100-000111644828v3.doc a3



Table R602.10.5 is amended to read as follows:

TABLE R602.10.5
WINIMUM LENGTH OF BRACED WALL PANELS

GUNILIUM LENGTH®
METHOD [aches CONTRIBUTING LENGTH
(B0% Table RE0Z.10.4) Wait Haight Enches)
Steml 9 fast 10 fost 11 lnat 12 et
DWB, WSP, SFR, PBS, PCP, HPS, BY-WSP 48 a8 T3 53 (] AcluaP
ce ] a |l | sl s | g lebesde dad
LB 55 62 ® NF | NP Actugl®
o | e [ A o [ v la]
“?ﬁp‘::d“" nt 3’15!: 22 | 22 | » | n | N
= Supporiing roof only 2| U] 6| R W 48
Supporting onc story androof | 24 b 4 r »r 43
PG 7] 27 30 W | 3¢ 1.5 % AcigaP
CS-G b7} 27 30 EX] 36 Adival
CSPF 624 B2 o = Actual
Adjacent clear opening beighy
{inches)
<64 2 7 30 33 36
3 26 27 30 33 3%
7] 77 ] 30 i %
7 10 » 0 33 %
%0 Az 30 30 3 3%
T} 33 7] 3 33 3
8 () kT 33 3 %
73 a3 37 ET] 35 %
% 48 4 T3 3 %
CS-WSP, CS-5FB 100 = 44 0 8 38
104 — 9 4 40 » Actual
108 == E] % 43 41
nz = = 50 a5 43
6 = == 55 a8 45
120 = = @ 52 48
124 = = — 3% ]
178 = — = 61 54
132 - = = & 54
36 = — — = 62
110 = = - L 73
[T} = = = = T

;31 inch = 254 mu, | foot = 304.8 @m, { mil; per hour= 0.447 mA.

= Mot Pemutted,
jocir miespolation shall be peemiticd.
he metual fength whed it i greater than of equd 1 the minima leagih.
b h&ghbrl’!'l‘lsswknhmdmvithHgnmamw.ﬁ_z,bmwnll}m;hmyhimzmdhlzlectwi&pwywlll.
opcning height for PG 1 10 feet in socondance with Figure R602.10.6.3, bt wall beight may be iacreased 0 12 feet with poay wall,
oz opening beght for CS.PF i 1 feet i acoardance with Figure RGOZ.10.5.4, bt w-all bight may be increwsed w0 12 feet with pomy wall,

‘\gmtmnumzsv&dx 34

City Clark of
the City of
Manhattan
Beach




Figure R602.10.6.1 is amended to read as foliows:

PANEL LEHGTH PER

TABLE R302 105 v’/ :

SHEATHING OF ONE FACE

MK 2 X4 FRAWING MIN,
OGUBLE STUDS REOGWRED.

fZJHOLO-COYN OR (2) STRAP-TYPE

BRALE D WALL PANEL HEGHT

OF EACH SHOWHFOR CLARITY)L
STRAR-TYPE AHCHORS SHALL BE
PERLUTTED TO 9E ATTACHED OVER
THE WOOU STRUCTURAL PANEL

PANEL JUST BE ATTACHED
TO CONCRETE FOOTING OR
CONCRETE FOUNDATION
WALL CONTINUDUS OVER
BRACED VALL LINE

ANCHORS PER TABLE RS02.10.4.1 (ONIX

2} " IANMETER ARGHOR
SOLTB LOCATED BETWEENM
& AND 127 OF EACH END OF
THE SEBLIENT

12100-0001\1644828v3.doc

FIGURE R602.10.6.1
METHOD ABW—ALTERNATE BRACED WALL PANEL

FOR PAKEL SFLICE ¢F NEEDED)
ADIDINING PANEL EDGES SHALL MEET
CVERAND EE FASTENED TO COUMON
FRAMING

20 COLMON-OR-BALY-DEK-NALE G &
O.C. AT PANELEDGES. FOR SINGLE
STORY AND G & 0.C. PANELECGES
FORTHE FIRST OF 2 8TORIES

STURS UNOER HEADER A9 REQLIRED

20 COMLUOLI-GRG-ud- D6 N-1LA @ 127
0.C AT {NTERICR SUPRORTS

MIN. REINE QRCING OF F QUNDATION,
ONE #4 BAR TOP ARD BOTTOM, LAP
BARS 4E~MINRIMA,

24

MINLUL FODTING BIJE UNDER
OPENING 1897 X 12

m’ o



Figure R602.10.6.2 is amended to read as follows:

pa————un{XTENT OF HZADL R WITH DQUELE PORTAL FRAKES {T\V0 BRACED WALL PARELS

e iy gRE
L i

_ 21 AINWSHED YADTH OF QPENE
7T POR SNOLE OR DOURE PORTAL — ]

TEN 30N STAAP PER E=fio - iy

TAILE R832 108 4 @
el DPPOSITE 10K OF
SHEATHING)
o NEEDRD, PANEL.
, SPUCE EDOES Exnlr E|

FAGTEN SREATERIG TO HEADER WATH 00 I DEOUR OVER AND D¢ "\_ FASTEN TOP

COULION OR DALVANCIED 002 AL 1 ¥ ORI RALED T CONY OH o

PATTERN AS SHOWR BLOCKING WITHEY WEADER yATH

HEADERTO JACK-ATUD STRAF PER TABLE [ erEy ',,"“' = )
3 RAOL104 ON BUTH ROLS OF OPENHG \ ROWOPTOC ROWS OF 160

TOPOBTE £ D8 OF PHEATRIIQ | EBKER MALS T
z g HALDIG 8§ AEQUIRED FOLTW
g § '\. MEACK PARELEBSS.
2 : 00, DOUBLE 2 FRAMRID €OVE RID WITH UIN. H Iy St
¥ 2 1507 6=THICKWOOD STRUCTURAL PARSL Si¢ AfhiHG. TYPCAL PORTAL | ] Frbed )
i WATH &0 COIKON O GALVARLZED BOXKALE AT FRAIE CORSTRUCTON PaxeL
b T0.C. W AL FRASIKG BTUD4, BLOCENG, AND. NEATHING

SHLB)TVS,

AP
iy, LEMOTH OF PANEL ML TABLE RAK 105 ANCAND LCEESER)-
HDERSENTURD

M. QTN L0 STRAP.TYPE HOLDDOWRS

(EMBEDCAD 1D CONCAETE AND RALED MTD has

FALIHG)

V. REWPORCNT OF FOUNDATION, OBZ 04 BAR
TOP AND BOTTON OF FODTING. LAP BARS 478
L ]

WA FOOTIMG B2 BHOER OFENING B 11X 12" & TLRNED.
DOV SLAR SHALL BF PERINTTED &Y DOOR OPENEIGS

WIN. (1} - DARETER AYCROR BOLT INSTALLED PER
RiDY 1 B-WHH I' X I° X JNE" PLA TEWR SHER

FRONT ELEVATION SECTION

FIGURE R602.10.6.2
METHOD PFH—PORTAL FRAME WITH HOLD-DOWNS

AT DET D OP| GS

Cartified to be
atrue copy of
gaid document
on filein my
office,

» City Clerk of
. the City of
| Manhattan
Beach

12100-000111644828v3 doc 36



Certifisd to ba
a true copy of
said document
on file in my
office.

ST

City Clerk of

the City of
Manhattan
Beach

Figure R602.10.6.4 is amended to read as follows:

e X THAT OF vl G WATH COUER,  POR T AL PRAMLS

SATENT OF ;MDA WiTH ERSOLE PORTAL PRI

108 SAACET L PN —
2o o oboeuang |
[ rom 5.GLE ORDOULLE PORTRY =
= TARE o6 WAl
,.,,,I‘ % OMROITE 0§
HRant OF SAAMNG
- AUti0 waL
WD WO ARG AL
I CRSLS oo rat s Ty
HETOF 10 e
oF o
: i el WALS AT O P,
gacen LA 4D
3 AONL HLB4 O BOTH $1083 DF ORLILG P ey
CPPOUTE NOROF ATHIS. ST RLOCRHY
g ! T 35 WAL s
H 0.
334 DO I RALING COVERED WITH 111 i i — . mewom
i 3 SR THER W00 BTRIC ToAAL PARE. i o H s
- SeEaTemell WIH T SCZON OR BALYA' 128D l | iy THIATHIG
WOX NALE AT ¥ OLC. I AL BRARSG(STUES, 2] I
R Bei. MWD ALY TR I: 1
AL
WL UBIGTH OF P, Pt TARLE ARIZ .6 ‘u\ o
1, 2 A2 CalAET R AmCavOR SOLTH [{ e —_— rOST
- BBT/ALLED R ALY S WTR PP A PLATE Er 100 AHD ACHETUDL
WS- ' AULRER OF
- T2
—— - —— b4t of
- LTI »
i s i . ., H
8 e h = . N N 4 i :
el A DR BOLTHPRA
OVERCONCRETE OR LASONAY BLOCK FOURDATION L -
T
iy LSl ETRUC A AL Pauin. .E. L] Il .
A APPLED ACHYSR
SEAWIG TOTP FBHOOR e § 7 sdahegienTama . g0l
v TASLE M2 XY CHPALITY OF 675 LB W FLATE O JOBT
e ML AR PR TARE
l‘-..\ —m—l\:nmrﬂ_ RO}
3 B L
APEROVID W
w00 JTRD O AT

'OVER RAIE D WOOU FLOOR - FRAMNNG ANCHOR DPTION
" WEIT LAP OVER 20T

e

. ADOY FN T TURAL AL BHEA T QU APPROLED BAHD OR Rald JOBT =
WOOD FLOCR - OVERLAS OP 10N
- PORTAL Ay on

FRONT ELEVATION

For 51, 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

FIGURE R$02.10.6.4
METHOD CS-PF-CONTINUQUSLY SHEATHED PORTAL FRAME PANEL CONSTRUCTION

12100-000 11 644828v3.doc 37



Section R602.10.9.1 is deleted in its entirety.

Section RB06.2.4 is amended 1o read as follows:

R606.2.4 Parape? walls.

Unreinforeed solid masonry parapet walls shall not be less than 8 inches (203 mm) thick and their
height shall not exceed four times their thickness. Unreinforced hollow unit masonry parapet walls
shall be not less than 8 inches (203 mm) thick, and their height shall not exceed three times their
thickness. Masonry parapet walls in areas subject to wind foads of 30 pounds per square foot (1.44
kPa) or located in Seismic Design Category Dy, Dy or D, or on townhouses in Seismic Design
Category C shall be reinforced in accordance with Section R606.12.

Section R606.12.2.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

R606.12.2.2.3 Reinforcement requirements for masonry elements. Masonry elements listed in
Section RB06.12.2.2.2 shall be reinforced in either the horizontal or vertical direction as shown in
Figure R606.11(3) and in accordance with the following:

1. Horizontal reinforcement. Horizontal joint reinforcement shall consist of Horizontal

reinforcement shall be provided within 16 inches (406 mm) of the top and bottom of these
masonry elements,

3. Vertical reinforcement. Vertical reinforcement shall consist of at least one No. 4 bar spaced

not more than 48 inches (1219 mm). Vertical reinforcement shall be within 8 inches (406mm)
of the ends of masonry walls.

Exception in Section R602.3.2 is amended to read as follows:

Exception: In other than Seismic Design Category Dy, D; or D, a single top plate may be installed in
stud walls, provided the plate is adequately tied at joints, corners and interesting walls by a minimum
3-inch-by-6-inch by a 0.036-inch-thick (76 mm by 152 mm by 0.914 mm) galvanized steel plate that is
nailed to each wall or segment of wall by six 8d nails on each side, provided the rafters or joists are
centered over the studs with a tolerance of no more than 1 inch (25 mm). The top plate may be
omitted over lintels that are adequately tied to adjacent wall sections with stee! plates or equivatent as

previously describad.
Section RB03.2.4 is added to read as follows:

R803.2.4 Openings in horizontal diaphragms.
Openings in hotizontal diaphragms shall conform with Section R503.2.4.

ion R1001.3.1 is amended to read as follows;

%%\R1001.3.1 Veriical reinforcing.
i“For chimneys up to 40 inches (1016 mm) wide, four No. 4 continuous vertical bars adequately
chored into the concrete foundation shall be placed between wylthes of solid masonry or within the
lIs of holiow unit masonry and grouted in accordance with Section R609. Grout shall be prevented
honding with the flue liner so that the flue finer is free to move with thermal expansion. For
imneys more than 40 inches (1016 mm) wide, two additional No. 4 vertical bars adequately
chored into the concrete foundation shall be provided for each additional flue incorporated into the
imney or for gach additional 40 inches (1016 mm) in width or fraction thereof.

12100-00011644828v3.doc 38

City Clerk of
the City of
Manhattan
Beach




SECTION 4.  Chapter 9.12 of the Manhattan Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as
follows:

“Chapler 8.12. ELECTRICAL CODE.
9.12.010 Adoption of California Electrical Code.

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 50022.1 to 50022.10, inclusive of the Government Code of the
State and subject to the particular additions, amendments, and deletions set forth in this chapter, the
rules, regulations, provisions, and conditions set forth in those certain Codes entitled “California
Electrical Code, 2013 Edition (“NEC"), * including the Annexes and Tables therein contained,
promulgated and published by the National Fire Protection Association of Quincy, Massachusatts and
the Cafifornia Building Standards Commission , including the Annexes and Tables therein contained,
one (1) full printed copy of which, printed as a Code in book form, was by the Council ordered filed
and which has been actually filed in the office of the City Clerk, expressly incorporated herein and
made a part herecf as fully and for all intents and purposes as though set forth herein at length, are
hereby established and adepted as the rules, regulations, standards, provisions, and conditions to be
observed and followed in the installation, arrangement, alteration, repair, use, and operation of
electrical wire connections, fixtures, and other electrical appliances, and subject to the additions,
amendments, and deletions set forth in this chapter, said Code with its Annexes and Tables,
containing said rules, regulations, standards, provisions, and conditions, is hereby established and

adopted by reference, and the same shall be designaled, known, and referred to as the “Electrical
Code” of and for the City.

9.12.020 Fees.
Section 89.108.4.2 is amended by adding the following paragraph:

ELECTRICAL PERMIT AND ELECTRICAL PLAN REVIEW FEES. Any person desiring an electrical
permit shall, at the time of filing an application therefor, pay to the City fees established by the
Council under the Fee Resolution in accordance to the building permit and bullding plan review fees
or may be based on an hourly rate as established in the applicable fee resolution.

9.12.030 Plans and specifications.
Section 83.108.4.3 is amended by adding the following paragraphs:

Electrical Plans and Specifications. When required by the Building Official, electrical plans,
specitications, and applications shall be filed and approved by the Building Official prior to any
electrical wiring or installations.

Electrical plans and specifications for all occupancies listed in the current adopted Uniform Building
Code shall be prepared by an Electrical Engineer who possesses a valid Professional Electrical
Engineering Registration issued pursuant to and in accordance with the laws of the State of
California.  All electrical sheets shall be wet stamped and have a wet signature by the licensed
Professionat Electrical Engineer.

Residential electrical plans shall include but are not limited to load schedule, wiring diagrams,
homeruns, wire sizes, location and size of service panels and subpanels, method of grounding of
service, The following must be included:

(1) All Commercial and Industrial tenant improvements, additions, and service
changes.

12100-000111644828v3.doc a9



SS

(2) The mixed Occupancy of R-2 and U Occupancy where U OCccupancy is between
1000 and 3000 square feet and over 200 amps.

(3) R-3 Occupancy and U Occupancy when service is over 200 amps.

“Green Sheet” Plans shall be prepared and submitted by a licensed elecirical contractor and/or
owner/builder under the foltowing conditions:

Excsption:

(1) R-3 Occupancy including new construction, additions, and service changes.

(2) U Occupancy (which is part of the R -3 Occupancy), which does not exceed 1000
square feet in area.

The Building Official may waive the submission of electrical pans, calculations, etc.,
if it is found that the nature of the work applied for is such that reviewing of slectrical
plans is not necessary to obtain compliance with this Code.

9.12,040 Penalties.

Section 89.108.3.2.6 is added to read as follows:

(&) Any person, firm, or corporation violating any of the provisions of this Chapter, or of the
Electrical Code adopted thereby, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and upon conviction of any
such violation such person shall be punishable by a fine of not more than one thousand
dollars or by imprisonment for a period of not to exceed six months, or by both such fine and
imprisonment in the discretion of the Court.

(b} Every such person shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and every day
during which, or during any portion of which, any of the provisions of this Code are violated,
committed, continued, or permitted by such person, and shall be punishable therefore as
herein provided.

9.12.050 Services undergrounding.

Section 230-30 is amended by the addition of subsection (5) to read as follows:

(5)Underground Utilities Required. All new buildings and structures in the City of Manhattan
Beach shall provide underground electrical and communication service laterals on the
premises to be served, as herelnafter raquired.

(a) New Construction. All electrical, telephone, cable television system, and similar
service wires and cables which provide direct service to new main buildings, new
accessory buildings, and structures, shall be installed underground in compliance
with all applicable building and electrical codes, safety regulations, and ordars, rules
of the Public Utilities Commission of the State of Califomia, and spacifications or
standards of the Public Works Department.

(b) Existing Buildings. Such service wires and cables shall also be placed
underground when existing buildings, existing accessory buildings, and structures are
repaired, remodeled, altered or expanded, except where the value, as determined for
bullding permit fee purposes, by the Building Code of the City of Manhattan Beach, of
such repairs or remodeling, or expansion does not exceed fity percent (50%) of the
value of the building or structure as determined by the California Building Code.

100-D00111644828v3.doc 40



City Clerk of

the City of
Manhattan
Beach

(c) Wiring between the accessory buildings and the main buildings shall be in an
underground system,

(d) Responsibility for Compliance. The Contractor and Owner are jointly and
severally responsible for complying with the requirements of this section and shall
make the necessary arrangements with the utility companies servicing the structure
for the installation of such tacilities.

If a proposed building or structure would create a situation which would make
unreasonable, Impractical, or physically impossible the continuance of overhead
utility service to an existing adjacent property (or properties), then the Contractor and
owner of the proposed building or structure shall be responsible for relocating such
utilities per ulility company specifications, and shall be installed underground in
compliance with all applicable codes, safety regulations, and orders, rules of the
Pubiic Utiliies Commission of the State of California, and specifications or standards
of the Public Works Depantment.

{e) Appurtenances. For the purpose of this section, appurtenances and associaled
equipment such as, but not limited to, service mounted transformers, pedestal
mounted terminal boxes and meter cabinets may be placed above ground if
permitted by and in accordance with the rules of the State Public Ultilities
Commission.

{h Waiver of Underground Requirements. If topographical, soil, or any other
conditions make such underground instalations unreasonable or impractical, a
waiver of the requirements of this section may be granted by the Building Official, (a
written approval from Southern California Edison is required when necessary) subject
to the installation of all necessary electrical conduits, terminal boxes and other
appurtenances as may be required to provide underground service in the future.

If the utility pole(s) from which underground service would be provided are not situaied on the same
side of the public street as the permitiee, or not within five (5) feet of the area enclosed by the
axtension of the side property lines to said public strest, the permitiee may have the alternative of
installing all condur, wires, pullboxes, elecirical panel and other appurtenances which may be
required for future underground utility services from the structure to an approved location on the
property line of the parcel which will facilitate future underground service; and that the properly may
continue to be served by overhead wires until said future underground wiility conversion.

If a building or structure is served by the rear from utilities not located in the public right-of-way, the
permittee may have the alternative of installing all conduit, wires, puliboxes, electrical panel, and
other appurtenances which may be required for future underground utility services from the building
or structure to an approved location on the property line of the parcel which will facilitate future
underground service; and that the property may continue to be served by overhead wires until said
future underground utility conversion.

Exceptions: This section shall not apply to:
0] Utility lines which do not provide service to the area being developed.

(i) Detached dwelling units with separate utility services which are not the subject of a
common including permit.

12100-000111644828v3.doc 41



]
City Clerk of

the City of
Manhattan
Beach

9.12.080 Service equipment.
Section 230-62 is amended by the addition of subsection (c) to read as follows:
{(c) Single Family Dwellings, Multi-family Industrial and Commercial Structures Service
Equipment. The minimum capacity of the service equipment for a single family
dwelling, industrial, and commercial structures shall be as follows:

(1) A service entry conduit not less than 1-1/2" in diameter of rigid galvanized steel,
axcept 100 amp service may be 1-1/4" rigid galvanized steel.
9.12.070 Grounding and bonding.
Section 250-53D. 2. is amended to add the following paragraph 1o add subsection (e) as follows:
Supplemental alectrode required. All services shall have a minimum 5/8" by 8-foot long ground rod
added, if not existing, when a new electrical service, water main or repipe is installed.
9.12.080 Conductor materlal.

Section 310.106(B) is amended to read as follows:

(B) Conductor material. Conductors in this article shall be of copper unless otherwise approved
by the Building Official.

9.12.090 Aluminum conductor material,

Section 310.15 is deleted.

9.12,100 Ampacities of varlous conductors.

Tables 310.15 (B) (16) - 310.15 (B) (21), including Notes lo said Tables, are amended to delete all
references to aluminum or copper-clad aluminum.

SECTION 5. Chapter 932 of Title 9 of the Manhattan Beach Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

Chapter 9.32: PLUMBING CODE

9.32.010 Adoption of Californla Plumbing Code.

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 50022.1 10 50022.10, inclusive, of the Government Code of the
State and subject to the particular additions, deletions and amendments sst forth in this chapter, the
rules, regulations, provisions and conditions set forth in that certain Code entitied “California
Plumbing Code 2013 E&dition,” including the Appendices therein contained, promulgated and
published by the Intemational Association of Plumbing and Mechanica! Officials, one (1) full printed
copy of which, printed as a Code in book form were by the Council ordered filed and which have heen
filed in the office of the City Clerk, expressly incorporated hersin and made a part hereof as fully and
for afl intents and purposes as set forth herein at length, are hersby established and adopted as the
rules, regulations, and provisions and conditions to be observed and followed in the maoving, removal,

12100-000111644828v3.doc 42




demolition, condemnation, maintenance and use of plumbing, house drainage, house sewers,
sanitary sewers, cesspools, septic tanks, gas piping, gas water heater vents, swimming pools, and
gas outlets for swimming pool heaters and related subjects, items and matters as set forth in said
Code, within the City. Subject to the additions, daletions and amendments set forth in this chapter,
said Code, with its said specified sections of Chapter 1, Division |, Appendices B, G, l,and L, is
hereby established and adopted by reference, and the same shall be designated, known and referred
to as the “Plumbing Code” of and for the City.

9.32.020 Violations and penalties.

Section 102.3.1 Is amended to read as follows:

Any person, firm or corporation violating any provisions of this Code shall be deemed guilty of a
misdemeanor and upon conviction thersot shall be punishable by a fine of not to exceed One
thousand and no/100™ ($1,000.00) Dollars or by imprisonment in the County Jail of the County of Los
Angeles, Calitornia, for not fo exceed six (6) months, or by both such fine and imprisonment. Each
separate day or any porlion thereof during which any violation of this Code oceurs or continues shall

be deemed to constitute a separate offense, and upon conviction thereof shali be punishable as
herein provided.

The Issuance or granting of a permit or approval of plans and specifications shall not be deemed or
conslrued to be a permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any of the provisions of this Code. No
permit presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the provisions of this Code shall be valid,
except insofar as the work or use which it autharized is lawful.

The issuance or granting of a permit or approval of plans shall not prevent the Administrative
Authority from thereafter requiring the correction of errars in said plans and spacifications or from
preventing construction operations being carried on thersunder when in violation of this Code or of
any other ardinance or from revoking any certificate of approval when issued in error,

Ever permit issued by the Administrative Authority under the provisicns of this Code shall expire by
limitation and become null and void, if the work authorized by such permit is not commenced within
one hundred eighty (180) days from date of such permit, or if the work authorized by such permit is
suspended or abandoned at any time atfter work is commenced for a period of one hundred eighty
(180) days. Before such work can be recommenced, a new permit shall be first obtained, and the fee
theretore shall be one-half the amount required for a new permit for such work, provided no changes
have been made, or will be made in the original plan and specifications for such work; and provided
further, that such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one (1) year. Whenever any work
for which a permit is required by this Code has been commenced without first obtaining said permit,
an additional fee shall be collected at the time when the permit is issued. This fee shall be equal to
the amount of the permit fees required by the most current City Resolution of Fees.

9.32.030 Plumbing permit fees.

Adopt Chapter 1, Division H, to specifically add and amend Section 102.1 of the California Plumbing
[ —=————_Code is hereby amended for administrative requirements as follows:

Table 103.4 Plumbing Permit Fees is hereby deleted. The fees shall be determined as required by
the most current City Resolution of Fees.

12100-000111644828v1.doc 43




9.32.040 Graywater systems general.
Section 1601A.0 is amended as follows:

Exception 1 Is deleted for the exemption from permit requirements

SECTION 6. Chapter 9.36 of Title 9 of the Manhattan Beach Municipal Code is amended to
read as follows:

“Chapter 9.36. SUSTAINABLE GREEN BUILDING PROGRAM AND ENERGY EFFICIENGCY
STANDARDS

9.36.010 Adoption of Californla Green Bullding Standards Code and Callfornia Energy Code.

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 50022.1 to 50022.10, inclusive, of the Govemment Code of the
State and subject to the particular additions, deletions and amendments set forth in this chapter, the
rules, reguiations, provisions and conditions set forth in that certain Code entitled “California Green
Building Standards Code 2013 Edition” and the “Califomia Energy Code 2013 Edition,” including the
Appendices therein contained, promulgated and published by the Califomia Building Standards
Commission, one (1) full printed copy of each, printed as a Code in book form were by the Council
ordered fited and which have been filed in the office of the City Clerk, expressly incorporated herain
and made a part herecf as fully and for all intents and purposes as set forth herein at length, are
hereby established and adopted as the rules, regulations, and provisions and conditions 1o be
observed and followed in the planning, design, operation, construction, demolition, use, occupancy,
operations and maintenance regarding the planning, design and construction of buildings and related
systems, equipment, and building components for energy efficiency, water efficiency and
conservation, material conservation and resource efficiency, and environmental quality enhancement
in the City and related subjects, items and matters as set forth in said Cade, within the City. Subject
to the additions, deletions and amendments set forth in this chapter, said Codes, with said
Appendices, are hereby established and adopted by reference, and the California Green Building
Standards Code shall be designated, known and referred to as "Sustainable Green Building Program”
and the California Energy Code shall be designated, known and referred to as the “Energy Efficiency
Standards” of and for the City.

Nothing in this chapter shall require the applicant o use covered products, as defined in the federal
Energy Policy and Conservation Act (42 U.S.C. §6201 et seq.), that excesd any applicable federal
energy conservation standards for such products.

9.36.020 Program and purpose.

A. This section sels forth a Sustainable Green Building Program as well as minimum Energy
Efficiency Standards within the City of Manhattan Beach for new construction and renovation as set
forth below.

B. The purpose of the chapter is to enhance the public health and welfare by promoting the
environmental and economic heallh of the City through the design, construction, maintenance,
operation and demolition of buildings and other site development by incorporating sustainable
building practices into all development. The sustainable building provisions referred to in this chapter
are designed to achieve the following goals:

1. Increase energy efficiency in buildings;

2. Encourage water and resource conservation through efficient fixtures and irrigation, recycled
and renewable materials;

12100-000111644828v3.doc 44



SS

3. Improve indoor air quality; increased natural lighting, and improved thermal comfort/control,
3. Reduce waste generated by construction projects;

4. Provide durable buildings that are efficient and econoemical te own and operate; and

5. Promote the health and productivity of residents, workers, and visitors to the City.

9.36.030 Definitions.

City: the City of Manhattan Beach, State of Califomia
City building: a building primarily funded by the City or on City owned land.
Compliance official: the Building Official or his or her designee.

Good falth effort: a project that has not met the required compliance threshold, but for

extenuating reasons, the Compliance official has found the project meets the good faith effort
provisions of Section 9.36.060.

LEED™: the “Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design” green building rating system
deveioped by the U.S. Green Building Gouncil {USGBC).

LEED® AP: A perscn who has been designated a LEED Accredited Professional by the
Green Building Certification Institute (GBCI).

LEED™ checkllst: The credit and point checklists developed by the Leadership in Energy and
Environmental Design Green Buiiding Rating System for measuring the sustainability,
efficiency, and environmentally soundness of a building,

Project: Any proposal for new or changed use, or for new construction, alteration, or
enlargement of any structure, that is subject to the provisions of this litle.

Renovation: any rehabilitation, repair, remodeling, changs, or modification to an existing
building, where changes to floor area and the footprint of the building are negligible. The
valuation of renovation improvements shall be determined by the Director of Community
Development per Section 10.68.030(E) of the Manhatian Beach Municipal Code. Additionally,
the compiiance official may exclude from such valuation the cost of (a) seismic upgrades, (b)

accessibiiity upgrades, or (c) photovoltaic panels or other solar energy or similar devices
exterior to the building.

Sustalnable building rating system: the rating system associated with specific sustainabie
building criteria and used to determine compliance thresholds. An example of a rating system
includes, but is not limited to, the LEED rating system.

9.36.040 Applicability.

A. Projects meeting the following thresholds and for which no use permit, variance, vesting
subdivision, or any other discretionary Ptanning approval has been granted, or for which no valid
building permit has been lawiully issued by the City prior to the effective date of this ordinance
shall comply with the provisions of this chapter:

1.

City buildings of 5,000 square feet or more of new “gross floor area” (new construction), as
defined by Section 10.04.030.

2. Renovations of or in City buildings of 5,000 gross square feet or more, where the project
exceads the total building replacement valuation of 50% of the enlire existing building as
12100-D001\1644828v3.doc a5



. 4

o

ad to ba
& copy of

documeant

e in my

S5

CeSinra

defined by Section 10.68.030(E) of the Manhattan Beach Municipai Code. For the purposes
of this section, estimated construction and reconstruction costs shall be determined by the
Community Development Director in the same manner as the Community Development
Director determines final valuation for the purposes of building permit fees.

Non-residential buildings of 10,000 square feet or more of “new gross floor area” (new
construction) as defined by Section 10.04.030.

Renovations of or in non-residential buildings 10,000 gross square feet or greater, where the
project exceeds the total building replacement valuation of 50% of the entire existing building
as defined by Section 10.68.030(E) of the Manhatian Beach Municipal Code. For the
purpases of this section, estimated construction and reconstruction costs shall be determined
by the Community Development Director in the same manner as the Community
Development Director determines final valuation for the purposes of building permit fees.

9.36.050 Standards for compliance:

A. The City shall adopt by reference the USGBC LEED™ green building rating system as the
standard for which a project shall be measured as a green building. Requiring projects to
incorporate LEED™ green building measures is necessary and appropriate fo achieve the

benefits of green building. The specific actions required for project compliance with this chapter
are as follows:

1.

All applicable projects are required to retain the services of a LEED® Accredited Professional
who is accredited in the appropriate category for the project as determined by the

Compliance official and complete LEED™ project registration prior to issuance of a building
permit.

All applicable projects shall submit a LEED checktist and supporting documentation indicating
points meeting at a minimum LEED ‘Silver level incorporated into documentation for a
building permit. Projects as described in Section 9.36.040 subsections 3. and 4. of 10,000
square feet or more of new gross square footage or more than 50% renovation shall meat
LEED ‘Silver' level. These projects would include, but not limited to, typical cffice, retail,
medical, private club, religious, and academic buildings with occupied and conditioned
spaces. A signed declaration from the LEED AP member of the Project team, siating thal the
plans and plan details have been reviewed, and that the Project meets the intent of the
criteria for certification of the selected LEED™ Rating System. The LEED checklist shalt be
prepared, signed, and dated by the project LEED accredited professional. Al building
documents shall indicate in the general notes and/or individual detail drawing, where feasible,
the green building measures employed to attain the applicable LEED rating.

Applicable City buildings are required to attain LEED cerlification and meet, at a minimum
LEED ‘Gold’ rating.

Building commissioning, although specified as a prerequisite for LEED™ certification, Is not
required for applicable projects under this chapter except for City bulldings. Applicants ara
encouraged to verify that fundamental building systems are designed, installed, and
calibrated to operate as intended,

All projects must demonstrate compliance with 2013 or the most recent California Energy
Efficiency Standards (Title 24, Part 6) by submitting all required forms and calculations for
review and approval by compliance official.

00-000111644828v3.doc 46



9.36.060 Compliance officlal's responsibilities

A. The compliance official shali review the required LEED™ checklist and supporting documentation
prior to issuance of a grading or building permit. Compliance official will use the appropriate
LEED™ scoring system applicable to project and categories within it.

B. The compliance official shall verify that the building measures and provisions indicated on the
project LEED™ checklist and on the supporting approved documentation, including approved plan

sels, are being implemented at foundation inspection, framing inspection, and prior to issuance of
& final certificate of occupancy.

C. The compliance official shall conduct any inspections as needed to ensure comphance with this
chapter.

9.36.070 Penalties and administrative remedies

A. If, as a result of any inspection, the compliance official determines that the applicable project
does not comply with the approved documentation, a stop work order may be issued. At the
discretion of the compliance official or designee such a stop work order may apply to the portion
of the project impacted by noncompliance or to the entire project. The stop work order shall
remain in effect until the compliance official determines that the project is in compliance with the
requirements of this chapter.

B. If the compliance official determines that the applicable project has not met the requirements of
the LEED™ checklist, as set forth in section 9.36.080 of this chapter, he or she shall determine on
a case by case basis whether the applicant has made a good faith effort to comply with this
chapter. In making this determination, the compiiance official shall consider the availability of
markets for materials 1o be recycled, the availability of sustainable building materials and
technologies, and the documented efforts of the applicant to comply with this chapter. The
compliance official or designes may require additional reasonable sustainable building measures

be included in the operation of the covered project to mitigate the failure to comply fully with this
chapter,

9.36.080 Mandatory and voluntary requirements.

Section 101.10 of the California Green Building Standards Cade is hereby amended to read as
follows:

101.10 Mandatory and voluntary requirements. This code contains both
mandatory and voluntary green building measures. Mandatory and voluntary measures are identified
in the appropriate application checklist contained in this code. The mandatory measures of Chapter 4
are applicable to residential buildings except where specifically amended hereinafter. The mandatory
measures of Chapter 5 are applicable to all buildings which are nonresidential buildings except where
specifically amended hereinafter. The Mandatory measures of Chapter 5 and voluntary measures of
Appendix A5 are applicable to all buildings, which qualify for conditions of section 9.36.040 excapt
where specifically amended hereinafter,

12100-000111644828v3.doc a7



9.36.000 Residential building

Section 301.1.1 of the California Green Building Standards Code is amended to read as follows:

Additions and alterations. (HCD) The Mandatory provisions of Chapter 4 shall ba applied to
additions or alterations of existing residential buildings within the specific area of the addition or
alteration. Code sections relevant to additions and alterations shall only apply to the portions of the
building being added or altered within the scope of permitted work.

9.36.120 Material conservation and resource efficiency
Section 4.408 of the California Green Building Standards Code is amended to read as follows:

4.408.1 [Residential] Construction waste reduction of at least 85% Recycle and/or salvage for
reuse a minimum of 65 percent of the nonhazardous construction and demofition debris. See
Municipai Code sections: 5.26.010 Definitions: “Diversion Requirement” 5.26.050 Review of Waste
Management Plan, and 5.26.060 Compliance with Waste Management Plan

4.408.4 Waste Stream reductions alternative. Projects that generate a total combined weight of
construction and demolition waste disposal of in landfills, which do not exceed four (4) |bs. /sq. fl. of
the building area shall meet the construction waste reduction requirements of section 4.408.1.

4.408.4.1 Waste stream reduction alternative. [HR]. Projects that generate a total combined weight
of construction and demolition waste disposal of in landfills, which do not exceed two (2) pounds per

square foot of the building area, shall meet the construction waste reduction requirements of section
4.408.1.

Section 5.408 of the Califoria Green Building Standards Code is amended 1o read as follows:

5.408.1 Construction waste management. Recycle and/or salvaga for reuse a minimum of 65
percent of the nonhazardous construction and demolition debris, See Municipai Code sections:
5.26.010 Definitions: “Diversion Requirement,” 5.26.050 Review of Waste Management Plan, and
5.26.060 Compliance with Waste Management Plan. Calculate the amount of materials diverted by
weight or volume, but not by both.

5.408.1.3 Waste stream reduction alternative. The combined weight of new construction disposal

that doss not exceed two pounds per square foot of building area may be deemed to meet the
minimum requirements of section 5.408.1.

9.36.130 Environmental quality
Section 4.501.1 of the California Green Building Standards Code is amended to read as follows:

4.501.1 [Residential] Scope and applicability The provisions of this chapter shall outline means
r§ducing the quantity of air contaminants that are odorous, irritating and/or harmful to the comfort
- well—being of a building’s instatlers, occupants and neighbors. Requirements for adhesives,
se= ants, caulks, and finishes shall apply to any construction. Fireplace Section 4.503 shall apply to
any new gas fireplaces.

55 121 1'1644828v3.doc



Section 4.503 of the California Green Building Standards Cods is amended to read as follows:

4.503.1 Fireplaces — General. Any installed gas fireplace shall be a direct-vent sealed-
combustion type with a 65% thermal efficiency. Any installed woodstove or pellet stove shall comply
with the U.S. EPA Phase Il emission limits where applicable. Woodsloves, pellet stoves and
fireplaces shall also comply with applicable local ordinances.

Section 5.501.1 of the Califomia Green Bullding Standards Code is amended to read as follows:

5.501.1 [Nonresidentlal] Scope and Applicabliity The provisions of this chapter shall outline
means of reducing the quantity of air contaminants that are odorous, irritating and/or harmful to the
comfort and well—being of a building’s installers, occupants and neighbors. Requirements for
adhesives, sealants, caulks, and finishes shall apply to any construction of renovation. Fireplace
Section 5.503 shall apply to any new gas fireplaces.

Section 5.503 of the California Green Building Standards Code is amended 1o read as follows:

5.503.1 Fireplaces ~ General. Install only direct-vent sealed-combustion type with a 65%
thermal efficiency gas or fireplace. Refer to residential requirements in the California Energy Code,
Title 24, Part 6, Subchapter 7, Section 150. Woodstoves, pellst stoves and fireplaces shall comply
with applicable local ordinances.

9.36.140 California Energy Code
Section 110.4(b)(2) of the Califoia Energy Code are amended to read as follows:

110.4 (b) 2. Covers. A thermal cover or blanket rated at not less than R-2 far outdoor pools or
outdoor spas that have a heat pump or gas heater.”

SECTION 7. Chapter 8.64 of Title 9 of the Manhattan Beach Municipal Cade is amended to
read as follows:

Chapter 9.64: MECHANICAL CODE
9.64.010 Adoption of California Mechanical Code.

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 50022.1 10 50022.10, inclusive, of the Govemment Code of the
State and subject to the particular additions, deletions and amendments set farth in this chapter, the
rules, regulations, provisions and conditions set forth in that certain Code entitied “Califomnia
Mechanical Code 2013 Edition,” including Appendix A therein contained, promulgated and puhlished
by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials of. One (1) full printed copy of
which, printed as a Code in book form were by the Council ardered filed and which have been filed in
the office of the City Clerk, expressly incorporated herein and made a part hereof as fully and for all
intents and purposes as set forth herein at length, are hereby established and adopted as the rules,
regulations, provisions and conditions to be observed and followed in the erection, installation,
alteration, repair, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of any heating ventilating,
comfort cooling, refrigerator systems, incinerators, or other miscellaneous heat producing appliances
in the ¢city; and subject to the additions, deletions, and amendments set forth in this chapter, said
Code with Appendix A, containing said rules, regulations, standards, provisions, and conditions is
hereby established and adopted by reference, and the same shall be designated, known and referred
tc as the “Mechanical Code” of and for the City.

12100-00¢111644828v3.doc 49



9.64.020 Violations and penalties.
Section 111.1 is amended to read as follows

Any person, firm or corporation violating any provisions of this Code shall be deemed guiity of a
misdemeanor and upon conviction thereof shail be punishable by a fine of not to exceed One
Thousand and no/100™ ($1,000.00) Dollars or by imprisonment in the County Jail of the County of
Los Angeles, California, for not to exceed six (6) months, or by both such fine and imprisonment.
Each separate day or any portion thereof during which any violation of this Code occurs or continues
shall be deemed to constitute a separate offense, and upon conviction thereaf shall be punishable as
herein provided. The issuance or granting of a permit or approval of plans and specifications shall
not be deemed or construed 1o be a permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any of the
provisions of this Code. No permit presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the provisions of
this Code shall be valid, except insofar as the work or use which it authorized is tawful.

The issuance or granting of a permit or approval of plans shall not prevent the Administrative
Authority from thereafter requiring the correction of errors in said plans and specifications or from
preventing construction operations being carried on thereunder when in violation of this code or of
any other ordinance or from revoking any certiticate of approval when issued in error.

9.64.030 Mechanical permit fees.
Section 114.1 is amended to read as follows:

114.1 General

Table 114.1 Mechanical Permit Fees is hereby dsleted. The fess shall be determined as required by
the most current City Resolution of Fees.”

SECTION 8. Chapler 526 of Titlte 5 of the Manhaftan Beach Municipa! Code entitled
CONSTRUCTION AND DEMOLITION DEBRIS WASTE REDUCTION AND RECYCLING
REQUIREMENTS is amended as provided in this Section.

Section 5.26.010 is amended by revising the following definition to read as follows:

Definitions. K. “Diversion requirement” means the redirection of at least sixty-five percent (65%) of
the total construction and demolition debris generated by a project via reuse or recycling, unless the
applicant has been granted an exemption pursuant to Section 5.26.070 of this chapter, in which case

the diversion requirement shall be the maximum feasible diversion rate established by the WMP
Compliance Official for the project.

Section 5.26.050 Review of Waste Management Plan, Subsactions A.2. and B, are amended as
tollows:

A.2. WMP must indicate that al least sixty-five percent (85%) of all C & D debris generated by the
project wilt be diverted.

B. Nonapproval. If the WMP Compliance Official determines that the WMP is incomplete or fails to

indicate that at least sixty-five percent (65%) of all C & D deabris generated by the project will be
reused or recycled, he or she shall either:

12100-000111644828v3 doc 50



S

Section 5.26.060 A. is amended by revising the first four {4} sentences to read as follows:

5.26.060 A. Documentation. Prior to the final building approval, the applicant shall submit to the
WMP Compliance Official documentation that it has met the diversion requirement for the project. If
the applicant does not submit the required documentation, he or she may be subject to an
administrative penalty or enforcement action as described in Sections 5.26.040 and 5.26.080 of this
chapter. The diversion requirement shall be that the applicant must divert at least sixty-five percent
(65%) of the total C & D debris generated by the project via reuse or recycling. Provided, however,
that an applicant granted an exemption pursuant to Section 5.26.070 of this chapter shall be required
1o comply with the maximum feasible diversion rate established by the WMP Compliance Official for
that project. [The balance of this subsection remains unchanged.]

SECTION 9. Any pravisions of the Manhatian Beach Municipal Gode, or appendices thereto,
or any other ordinances of the City, to the extent that they are inconsistent with this ordinance, and no
turther, are hereby repealsd.

SECTION 10. It any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this ordinance is for
any reasen held to be invalid or unconstitutional by the decision of any court of competent jurisdiction,
such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of the ordinance. The City Council
hereby declares that it would have passed this ordinance and each section, subsection, sentence,
clause, and phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections,
sentences, clauses, or phrases be declared invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION 11. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this ordinance is for
any teason held to be invalid or unconstitutional by the decision of any court of competent jurisdiction,
such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of the ordinance. The City Councll
hersby declares that it would have passed this ordinance and each seclion, subsection, sentence,
clause, and phrase thereol, imespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subseclions,
sentences, clauses, or phrases be declared invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION 12. This notice shall be published by one insertion in The Beach Reporter, the
official newspaper of the City, and this ordinance shall take effect and be in full force and operation
thirty {(30) days after its final passage and adoption.

SECTION 13. The City Clerk shall cerlify 1o the adoption of this erdinance; shall cause the
same to be entered in the book of original ordinances of said City; shall make a minute of the
passage and adoption thereof in the records of the meeting at which the same is passed and
adopted; and shall within fifteen (15) days after the passage and adoption thereof cause the same to
be published by one insertion in The Beach Reporter, the official newspaper of the City and a weekly

newspaper of general circulation, published and circulated within the City of Manhattan Beach hereby
designated for that purpose.

SECTION 14. This Ordinance will become effective at 12:01 a.m. oh January 1, 2014

12100-000111644828v3.doc 51



SECTION 15. The City Clerk shall cause a summary of this Ordinance to be published as
provided by law. The summary shall be published and a certified copy of the full text of this
Ordinance shall be posted in the Office of the City Clerk at least five (5) days prior to the City Council
maeting at which this Ordinance is to be adopted. Within fifteen (15) days after the adoption of this
Ordinance, the City Clerk shall cause a summary to be published with the names of those City
Council members voting for and against this Ordinance and shali post in the Office of the City Clerk a
certified copy of the full text of this Ordinance along with the names of those City Council members
voting for and against the Ordinance.

PASSED, APPROVED and ADOPTED this 19th day of November, 2013,

Ayos:
Noes:

@W&_

2 ?dy of Manhatian Beach, California

ATTEST:

City Clerk of the City of
Manhattan Beach, California

12100-0001\1644828v3 doe 52



o Adod e sajyosgy -
mucmrcbcmrcm 40 mco_umu_tum:_. 9)lenjeAs Jlou [[IM DS9D :
1d19oal a3pajmoude |Im Hsgy -

paisanbai 1diaoas uinias yum jlew paiisy -

UBMODIIA SaWe :U0IJUdIIY
€€8S6 eluJojije) ‘ojusweldes
O€T 3UNS ‘DAIIQ died SeWOleN S767
uolssiwwo) splepuels uipjing eiulojije)
uolssiwwo) spiepueis 3uipjing ejuioied ay3
HM Sjuswipuswie ay3 yum 3uole pajy aq 3snw suonedyisng -

suoneaynsnyp




